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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 10 June 2022 5:57 PM

To: simleeconstruction@gmail.com; SUR

Subject: RE: GBG 4429K-DOA: 13/5/2022 (MSIG OD) 

Attachments: GBG 4429K SUPPLEMENTARY.pdf

Dear Luqi, 

 

 

Above has been approved. 

 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: simleeconstruction@gmail.com <simleeconstruction@gmail.com>  

Sent: Friday, 10 June 2022 2:30 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: GBG 4429K-DOA: 13/5/2022 (MSIG OD)  

 

Hi Veron, 

 

Please let me know once you have approval as the vehicle has been stuck at our workshop for 5 days. 

 

 

 

Thank you. 

 

Regards, 

Luqi Liew (Mr.) 

 

Sim Lee Construction & Transport Pte. Ltd. 
7 Soon Lee Street #05-08 Ispace Singapore 627608 

UEN: 198404289G | Tel: 6397 4285 | Fax: 6397 4287 

 

The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in message only. It is strictly forbidden to share 

any part of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender. If you received this message by mistake, 

please reply to this message and follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur in the future. 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 9 June 2022 2:34 pm 

To: simleeconstruction@gmail.com; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: GBG 4429K-DOA: 13/5/2022 (MSIG OD)  

 

Dear Sir, 
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We are still pending approval from MSIG. 

 

Will send them a chaser. 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: simleeconstruction@gmail.com <simleeconstruction@gmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 9 June 2022 11:33 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: GBG 4429K-DOA: 13/5/2022 (MSIG OD)  

 

Dear Veron, 

 

We have submitted a supplementary quotation for 2 more spare part to your surveyor that’s attached for your 

reference. 

Please let us know if there is any updates on approval for the supplementary parts. 

 

 

Thank you. 

 

Regards, 

Luqi Liew (Mr.) 

 

Sim Lee Construction & Transport Pte. Ltd. 
7 Soon Lee Street #05-08 Ispace Singapore 627608 

UEN: 198404289G | Tel: 6397 4285 | Fax: 6397 4287 

 

The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in message only. It is strictly forbidden to share 

any part of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender. If you received this message by mistake, 

please reply to this message and follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur in the future. 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Sunday, 5 June 2022 8:50 am 

To: simleeconstruction@gmail.com; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: GBG 4429K-DOA: 13/5/2022 (MSIG OD)  

 

Dear Sir, 

 

 

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle GBG 4429K, part by part repair 

under cost price. (Excess $1500/-). 

 

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 

6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  
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All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company 

before completion of the repair. 

 

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 

 

Please provides parts invoice upon finalize. 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


