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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 20 March 2023 8:37 AM
To: 'ENG HUEY NI'
Cc: Admin A; MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22  ll Our Ref: 

22/22/22/VC05/025842

Dear Sirs, 
 
For an update, we have settled the matter at a global sum of $24,200.00(all-in). 
 
We will proceed to close file and submit all the relevant document to your good office once it is ready. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, November 28, 2022 5:34 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22 ll Our Ref: 22/22/22/VC05/025842 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
For LOU, please try to offer from $1700.00 ($100 x 17d) to $2210.00 ($130 x 17d). 
 
Therefore, total mandate is up to 24,496.04 
 
Thank you.  
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eng Huey Ni 
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Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9244 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 28 November 2022 11:43 am 
To: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] - YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22 ll Our Ref: 22/22/22/VC05/025842 
 
Your ref: 21/22/22/VC05/025842 
Our ref : CC4/LPC22005171/Epa3q2 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD7846A(LONPAC) / YQ1078J(TP) / GBB3436Y ON 25/05/2022 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Our driver collided onto 2 vehicles that was parked. We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’s favour. 
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD" acting on behalf of YQ1078J at $25,166.04 
(all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
   

Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 31,377.82 $ 22,166.34 ($20,716.21 + 7%GST) 
2. Loss of USE (128days x $180.00) $ 23,040.00 $   2,880.00 (16days x $180.00) 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $          2.00 $          2.00 
4. Towing Fee $      117.70 $      117.70 

Total $ 54,537.52 $ 25,166.04 
   
Surveyor recommended 13days for repair + 1PRS + 2SUNDAY = 16days. 
 
Market Value : $ 90,000.00 (est) 
LTA Rebate : $ 20,086.00 (est) 
Nett Value : $ 69,914.00 (est) 
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 23/11/2022 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, 6 July 2022 3:59 pm 
To: Suann <suann@mova.com.sg> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK 
Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22 ll Our Ref: 22/22/22/VC05/025842  
  

Lonpac External - General 
  
Hi Suann, 
  
We are prepared to do a direct settlement based on our surveyor’s recommendation. 
  
Please liase with Ms Cecilia of LKK on the direct settlement. 
  
Thank you.  
  
Aside to Cecilia – ok to proceed with direct settlement. Please follow up with the 
necessary. Thanks 
  
  
Best Regards 
  
Eng Huey Ni 
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9244 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
  

 
  
  
  
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Suann <suann@mova.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 5 July 2022 4:58 pm 
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To: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22 ll Our Ref: 22/22/22/VC05/025842 
  
Dear Huey Ni, 
  
Please check outcome. 
  
Thank you 
  
  
Best Regards 
Suanne Chiu 
Claims Asst.Manager 
MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd 
Tel: +65 6262 3377  ext - 0  
Fax: +65 62643151  
  

 
  

Connect with us on  
  
Privileged/Confidential Information may be contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or responsible for delivery of 
the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the 
sender by reply email. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not be deemed as unless 
otherwise indicated by an authorized representative independent of this message. 
  

From: ENG HUEY NI [mailto:hneng@lonpac.com]  
Sent: Saturday, 25 June 2022 12:26 
To: Suann 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; GERALD POH WEE BIN 
Subject: RE: YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22 ll Our Ref: 22/22/22/VC05/025842 
  

Lonpac External - General 
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Hi Suann, 
  
Our insured has not responded to us on our enquiries and request. 
  
We are sending chasers to our insured. 
  
Please bear with us for a little while. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
Best Regards 
  
Eng Huey Ni 
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9244 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 16 June 2022 12:39 pm 
To: Suann <suann@mova.com.sg> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22 
  

Lonpac External - General 
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Suann, 
  
I shall get my colleague, Huey Ni to look into the matter. 
  
  
Aside to Huey Ni, 
  
             FYA  
  
Best Regards 
  
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
  
  
  
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Suann <suann@mova.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 16 June 2022 12:31 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)' <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22 
  
Dear Gerald, 
  
Please look into this matter & let us have your advice. 
  
Thank you 
  
  
Best Regards 
Suanne Chiu 
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Claims Asst.Manager 
MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd 
Tel: +65 6262 3377  ext - 0  
Fax: +65 62643151  
  

 
  

Connect with us on  
  
Privileged/Confidential Information may be contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or responsible for delivery of 
the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the 
sender by reply email. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not be deemed as unless 
otherwise indicated by an authorized representative independent of this message. 
  

From: Suann [mailto:suann@mova.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 14 June 2022 11:38 
To: 'Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)'; 'Admin A' 
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; 'Brian' 
Subject: RE: YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22 
  
Dear Cecilia, 
  
Enclosed is your insured addendum report, please look into it and review this matter.  
  
  
Thank you 
  
  
Best Regards 
Suanne Chiu 
Claims Asst.Manager 
MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd 
Tel: +65 6262 3377  ext - 0  
Fax: +65 62643151  
  

 
  

Connect with us on  
  
Privileged/Confidential Information may be contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or responsible for delivery of 
the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the 
sender by reply email. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not be deemed as unless 
otherwise indicated by an authorized representative independent of this message. 
  

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 9 June 2022 17:09 
To: Suann; Admin A 
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; 'Brian' 
Subject: RE: YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22 
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Hi Suann,  
  
The liability is down against our insured as approved by our principal. However, our principal instructs not to agree 
with Direct Settlement as investigation on-going due to OI vehicle having brake issue as reported.  
  
As such, kindly hold hand.  
  
Thanks  
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. 
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  
Best Regards, 
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: Suann <suann@mova.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 9 June 2022 5:13 pm 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'Brian' <brian.eng@mova.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22 
  
Dear Cecilia, 
  
This case has been pending almost 2 weeks, please let us have your confirmation soonest possible. 
  
Thank you 
  
  
Best Regards 
Suanne Chiu 
Claims Asst.Manager 
MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd 
Tel: +65 6262 3377  ext - 0  
Fax: +65 62643151  
  

 
  

Connect with us on  
  
Privileged/Confidential Information may be contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or responsible for delivery of 
the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the 
sender by reply email. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not be deemed as unless 
otherwise indicated by an authorized representative independent of this message. 
  

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 7 June 2022 11:26 
To: Suann; Admin A 
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; 'Brian' 
Subject: RE: YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22 
  
Without Prejudice 
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Hi Suann,  
  
Investigation still on-going.  
  
Please hold hand.  
  
Thanks  
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. 
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  
Best Regards, 
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: Suann <suann@mova.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 7 June 2022 9:36 am 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'Brian' <brian.eng@mova.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22 
  
Dear Cecilia, 
  
Please check outcome. 
  
Thank you 
  
  
Best Regards 
Suanne Chiu 
Claims Asst.Manager 
MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd 
Tel: +65 6262 3377  ext - 0  
Fax: +65 62643151  
  

 
  

Connect with us on  
  
Privileged/Confidential Information may be contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or responsible for delivery of 
the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the 
sender by reply email. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not be deemed as unless 
otherwise indicated by an authorized representative independent of this message. 
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From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 2 June 2022 17:18 
To: Suann; Admin A 
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; 'Brian' 
Subject: RE: YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22 
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Hi Suann,  
  
Please hold hand, as investigation is on-going.  
  
We will update you once our principal provide instruction to DS.  
  
Thanks  
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. 
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  
Best Regards, 
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: Suann <suann@mova.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 2 June 2022 2:59 pm 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'Brian' <brian.eng@mova.com.sg> 
Subject: YQ1078J & XD7846A on 25/5/22 
  
Dear sir / madam, 
  
Your surveyor has surveyed my client vehicle on 1/6/22. 
Please advice the liability for direct settlement.  
  
Thank you 
  
  
Best Regards 
Suanne Chiu 
Claims Asst.Manager 
MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd 
Tel: +65 6262 3377  ext - 0  
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Fax: +65 62643151  
  

 
  

Connect with us on  
  
Privileged/Confidential Information may be contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or responsible for delivery of 
the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the 
sender by reply email. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not be deemed as unless 
otherwise indicated by an authorized representative independent of this message. 
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