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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <LeeGek.Tan@strides.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 July 2022 09:04
To: CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: LOD   Re: Accident on 28/5/2022 involving SHB 5102B & SLC 3576C (AIG's insured)   

Our Ref: TAX/05/22/2081/lg 
Attachments: 05 21 2081 - supporting documents.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Dear All, 
  
We quantify our own losses as follows:-  
       
Cost of Repair $2,057.49           

Loss of Rental $547.50 ( 7.5 days x $73.00 ) 
LTA Search Fee $7.00           
Total $2,611.99           

 
We enclose the following documents:-  

1) Repair invoice  
2) Proof of rental rate 
3) Police/GIA reports  
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report 
5) Hirer’s letter of authorisation  
6) LTA search 
  

Our relief driver Ms Nazreen Banu Binte Gose Ahmad Sha (NRIC No. SXXXX341C) is claiming her injury and loss 
of income (based on her mc) through her own lawyer. Our hirer Mr Mujbour Rahman s/o Abdul Jaleel took a 
replacement taxi on 30/5/2022 at 5.35pm so no claim for his loss of income.  
 
Please acknowledge receipt within 14 days from the date hereof and let us have your offer soon. Thanks. 
 
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548) 
Claims Department 
STRIDES Automotive Services Pte Ltd  
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 7 July 2022 10:35
To: JEFFREYWONG39BB@GMAIL.COM
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLC 3576C AND SHB 5102B ON 28/05/2022

Our Ref: CC3/AIG22005153/Kea3 
                    
 
7 July 2022 
                                                   
WONG CHEE MUN(HUANG ZI WEN) 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLC 3576C AND SHB 5102B ON 28/05/2022 
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against 
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate 
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial 
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be 
deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.  
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 
 
 
Asher Sng 
Case Handler 
DID: 6841 6051 
Email: Ashersng@lkkauto.com 
 
c.c.         AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd               
             (Motor Claims Dept) 
 




	83d1bc7da82e5eb5ba4fc0ce8dbd4f9857fe4e58759eb0b00e4ab2594389cb69.pdf
	Merimen e-Claims

