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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: ANG PEI XUAN (MINDEF) <ANG_Pei_Xuan@defence.gov.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 4 October 2022 10:47 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KRISTINE TAN FOONG YI (MINDEF); KUNASEGARAN S/O 

BADIVEL (MINDEF)
Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: [Seek Mandate] - Your Ref: MID59375 // LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/Rp

Message Classification: Official Open  
Hi Ms Hsiao Tong, 
Note and Thank you for the reply. 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, October 4, 2022 9:46 AM 
To: ANG PEI XUAN (MINDEF) <ANG_Pei_Xuan@defence.gov.sg>; KRISTINE TAN FOONG YI (MINDEF) 
<TAN_Kristine@defence.gov.sg>; KUNASEGARAN S/O BADIVEL (MINDEF) <Kunasegaran1@defence.gov.sg> 
Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [Seek Mandate] - Your Ref: MID59375 // LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/Rp 
 
Message Classification: Official Open  
Dear Ms Ang, 
 
Please be informed that third party vehicle is insured with M/s Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited 
which is non-signatory to TCA. As such TCA is not applicable. 
 
Thank you. 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: ANG PEI XUAN (MINDEF) <ANG_Pei_Xuan@defence.gov.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 28 September 2022 1:13 PM 
To: KRISTINE TAN FOONG YI (MINDEF) <TAN_Kristine@defence.gov.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com>; KUNASEGARAN S/O BADIVEL (MINDEF) <Kunasegaran1@defence.gov.sg> 
Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: [Seek Mandate] - Your Ref: MID59375 // LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/Rp 
 
Message Classification: Official Open  
Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
May I check is this case TCA applicable ?  
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Get Outlook for iOS 

From: KRISTINE TAN FOONG YI (MINDEF) <TAN_Kristine@defence.gov.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, September 28, 2022 11:48:33 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; KUNASEGARAN S/O BADIVEL (MINDEF) 
<Kunasegaran1@defence.gov.sg>; ANG PEI XUAN (MINDEF) <ANG_Pei_Xuan@defence.gov.sg> 
Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: [Seek Mandate] - Your Ref: MID59375 // LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/Rp  
  
Message Classification: Official Open  
Hsiao Tong,  
 
Approved. Go ahead.  
 
Regards,  
Kristine  
 
Get Outlook for iOS 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, September 28, 2022 10:18:30 AM 
To: KUNASEGARAN S/O BADIVEL (MINDEF) <Kunasegaran1@defence.gov.sg>; ANG PEI XUAN (MINDEF) 
<ANG_Pei_Xuan@defence.gov.sg> 
Cc: KRISTINE TAN FOONG YI (MINDEF) <TAN_Kristine@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) 
<olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [Seek Mandate] - Your Ref: MID59375 // LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/Rp  
  
2nd Reminder 
  
Your ref: WY 22/23/001 
LKK ref : CC2/MIDF22005148/Rpq2 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID59375 AND SDS5425C ON 21/05/2022 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Please be informed that our SAF driver failed to stop at stop line and collided onto civilian who was on main road. 
We are of the view our SAF driver is at fault. 
  
We would like to seek your approval to negotiate and settle with civilian repairer. 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
   

Claimed Amount Mandate Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $  9,574.36 $ 4,547.50 ($4,250.00 + 7%GST) 
2. Loss of Rental(16days x $120.00) $  1,920.00 $    800.00 (8days x $100.00) 
3. LTA Search Fee $         7.45             N.A 

Total $11,501.81 $ 5,347.50 
  
Enclosed herewith : - 

 Survey Report & Photos – SDS5425C. 
 LOD – SDS5425C 
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 SAF Report & Photos -  MID59375 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 3:53 PM 
To: KUNASEGARAN S/O BADIVEL <Kunasegaran1@defence.gov.sg>; ANG PEI XUAN 
<ANG_Pei_Xuan@defence.gov.sg> 
Cc: KRISTINE TAN FOONG YI <TAN_Kristine@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [Seek Mandate] - Your Ref: MID59375 // LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/Rp 
  
Reminder 
  
Your ref: WY 22/23/001 
LKK ref : CC2/MIDF22005148/Rpq2 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID59375 AND SDS5425C ON 21/05/2022 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Please be informed that our SAF driver failed to stop at stop line and collided onto civilian who was on main road. 
We are of the view our SAF driver is at fault. 
  
We would like to seek your approval to negotiate and settle with civilian repairer. 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
   

Claimed Amount Mandate Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $  9,574.36 $ 4,547.50 ($4,250.00 + 7%GST) 
2. Loss of Rental(16days x $120.00) $  1,920.00 $    800.00 (8days x $100.00) 
3. LTA Search Fee $         7.45             N.A 

Total $11,501.81 $ 5,347.50 
  
Enclosed herewith : - 

 Survey Report & Photos – SDS5425C. 
 LOD – SDS5425C 
 SAF Report & Photos -  MID59375 
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Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Thursday, 11 August 2022 10:58 AM 
To: KUNASEGARAN S/O BADIVEL (MINDEF) <Kunasegaran1@defence.gov.sg>; ANG PEI XUAN (MINDEF) 
<ANG_Pei_Xuan@defence.gov.sg> 
Cc: KRISTINE TAN FOONG YI (MINDEF) <TAN_Kristine@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) 
<olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [Seek Mandate] - Your Ref: MID59375 // LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/Rp 
  
Your ref: WY 22/23/001 
LKK ref : CC2/MIDF22005148/Rpq2 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID59375 AND SDS5425C ON 21/05/2022 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Please be informed that our SAF driver failed to stop at stop line and collided onto civilian who was on main road. 
We are of the view our SAF driver is at fault. 
  
We would like to seek your approval to negotiate and settle with civilian repairer. 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
   

Claimed Amount Mandate Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $  9,574.36 $ 4,547.50 ($4,250.00 + 7%GST) 
2. Loss of Rental(16days x $120.00) $  1,920.00 $    800.00 (8days x $100.00) 
3. LTA Search Fee $         7.45             N.A 

Total $11,501.81 $ 5,347.50 
  
Enclosed herewith : - 

 Survey Report & Photos – SDS5425C. 
 LOD – SDS5425C 
 SAF Report & Photos -  MID59375 

  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
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Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 2:59 PM 
To: KUNASEGARAN S/O BADIVEL (MINDEF) <Kunasegaran1@defence.gov.sg>; ANG PEI XUAN (MINDEF) 
<ANG_Pei_Xuan@defence.gov.sg> 
Cc: KRISTINE TAN FOONG YI (MINDEF) <TAN_Kristine@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) 
<olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: MID59375 // LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/Rp 
  
Hi Mr Kuna, 
  
Received with thanks. 
  
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  
From: KUNASEGARAN S/O BADIVEL (MINDEF) <Kunasegaran1@defence.gov.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 3 June 2022 2:11 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; ANG PEI XUAN (MINDEF) <ANG_Pei_Xuan@defence.gov.sg> 
Cc: KRISTINE TAN FOONG YI (MINDEF) <TAN_Kristine@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) 
<olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: MID59375 // LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/Rp 
  

Good Afternoon Ms Hsiao Tong / Ms Jaslin, 
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Attached is the incident report for MID59375. 

  

1.       IOD 
2.       Police Repot 
3.       MID Vehicle Photos 
4.       Sketch 

  

Regards. 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this 
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, 
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any 
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under  
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately  
if you receive this in error." 

<<Message from Defence Mail Administrator>>: Please be informed that the direct URL linking and 
clicking has been disabled. Copy and paste the URL to the browser to access the website. Thank you. 

  
  
  
  
  
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, June 2, 2022 8:54 AM 
To: KUNASEGARAN S/O BADIVEL (MINDEF) <Kunasegaran1@defence.gov.sg>; ANG PEI XUAN (MINDEF) 
<ANG_Pei_Xuan@defence.gov.sg> 
Cc: KRISTINE TAN FOONG YI (MINDEF) <TAN_Kristine@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) 
<olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Your Ref: MID59375 // LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/Rp 
  
Your Ref: MID59375 
LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/Rp 
  
Dear Sirs, 
  
We have received third party claim notification on 31/05/2022 and we have conducted inspection for SDS5425C. 
  
Please refer to the attached appraisal of damaged vehicle before repair and photos for your perusal. 
  
Kindly let us have the following documents for our necessary action: - 
  

 IOD 
 MID59375 SAF Statement 
 MID59375 SAF Police Report 
 MID59375 Vehicle Photos 
 MID59375 Schematic Diagram 

  
Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this 
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, 
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any 
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under  
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately  
if you receive this in error." 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this 
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, 
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any 
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under  
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately  
if you receive this in error." 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this 
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, 
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any 
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under  
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately  
if you receive this in error." 
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