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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 28 October 2022 10:06 AM
To: claims@carzauto.com.sg; aun_nee@carzauto.com.sg
Subject: RE: LOD vehicle number: SDS5425C   //LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/p
Attachments: DV_SDS5425C.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
We confirm settlement at $5,247.50(ALL-IN). 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
Kindly let us have your company’s bank details for our necessary action: - 
 

Account Name  
Account Number  
Bank Name  
Bank & Branch Code  

 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: claims@carzauto.com.sg <claims@carzauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 17 October 2022 10:04 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; aun_nee@carzauto.com.sg 
Subject: RE: LOD vehicle number: SDS5425C //LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/p 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong,  
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Morning.  
 
Any updates? 
 
Thanks. 
 
Rgds, 
Jon 
 

From: claims@carzauto.com.sg <claims@carzauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 4 October 2022 10:43 am 
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'aun_nee@carzauto.com.sg' <aun_nee@carzauto.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: LOD vehicle number: SDS5425C //LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/p 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong,  
 
We confirm acceptance of $5247.50. 
 
Thanks. 
 
Rgds, 
Jon 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 4 October 2022 9:52 am 
To: claims@carzauto.com.sg 
Subject: RE: LOD vehicle number: SDS5425C //LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/p 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 

We propose settlement as follows: - 

  
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 4,547.50 
2. Loss of Rental (7days x $100.00) $    700.00 

Total $ 5,247.50 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 28 September 2022 10:19 AM 
To: claims@carzauto.com.sg 
Subject: RE: LOD vehicle number: SDS5425C //LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/p 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We are still pending mandate approval from our principal. 
 
We will follow up and get back to you. 
 
Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: claims@carzauto.com.sg <claims@carzauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Saturday, 24 September 2022 11:08 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; claims@carzauto.com.sg 
Subject: RE: LOD vehicle number: SDS5425C //LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/p 
 
Hi Ms. Chew,  
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Any update on the offer for this case? LOD has been mailed over on 12 July 2022.  
 
We hope to close this case soonest possible.  
 
Thanks.  
 
Regards, 
Aun Nee 
8363 3061 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 12, 2022 5:09 PM 
To: claims@carzauto.com.sg 
Cc: aun_nee@carzauto.com.sg 
Subject: RE: LOD vehicle number: SDS5425C //LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/p 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 12/07/2022. 
 
We will look into the matter and get back to you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: claims@carzauto.com.sg <claims@carzauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 12 July 2022 12:15 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: aun_nee@carzauto.com.sg 
Subject: RE: LOD vehicle number: SDS5425C //LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/p 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong,  
 
Good afternoon.  
 
Attached is our Letter of demand and the necessary documents for your kind processing.  
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Thanks. 
 
Best Rgds, 
Jonathan 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 31 May 2022 3:20 pm 
To: claims@carzauto.com.sg; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: aun_nee@carzauto.com.sg; 'Jonathan' <Jonathan@carzauto.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Request Surveyor for pre-repair inspection vehicle number: SDS5425C //LKK Ref: CC2/MIDF22005148/p 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 31/05/2022. 
 
Hi Yan, 
 
Kindly assist to arrange for survey. Thanks. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: claims@carzauto.com.sg <claims@carzauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 31 May 2022 3:16 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: aun_nee@carzauto.com.sg; 'Jonathan' <Jonathan@carzauto.com.sg> 
Subject: Request Surveyor for pre-repair inspection vehicle number: SDS5425C  
 
Hi Sir  
 
Good Afternoon  
 
I am writing to enquire about an arrangement of pre-repair inspection survey for vehicle number: SDS5425C.
I hope that you may help us inform surveyor that the vehicle are in our workshop and ready to be survey.  
Our workshop located at 61 Woodland Industrial Park E9 #04-04 (Premium 9) Singapore 757047. 
If you need more information about this case, please do not hesitate to email or contact me. 
 
Thank You.  
 
With Regards, 
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Jeslyn Chua  
HP: 9380 9969 

 
 
 
 


