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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 13 July 2022 9:30 AM
To: Eng Pau Low
Subject: RE: Our Ref:  SNE1985J220523  Your Ref:   YM7313L
Attachments: DV_SNE1985J.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Eng Pau Low <smc_eplow@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 8 July 2022 3:02 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Our Ref: SNE1985J220523 Your Ref: YM7313L 
 

We hereby confirm acceptance of your offer.  

Kindly let us have your discharge for our client's execution and your cheque made in our favour as soon as possible. 
 
Thank 
 
Best Regard 
 
Susan Low 
M/s SMC Auto Engineering Works 
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 417883 



2

Tel: 6741 1731 
 
 
 
On Tuesday, 5 July 2022 at 08:49:59 am SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:  
 
 
Without Prejudice 
(save as to costs) 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We are prepared to revise our offer as follows: - 
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 6,848.00 
2. Loss of Use (9days x $70.00) $    630.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $        2.00 

Total $ 7,480.00 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole 
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, 
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 
terms/settlement.” 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Eng Pau Low <smc_eplow@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 4 July 2022 10:31 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Our Ref: SNE1985J220523 Your Ref: YM7313L 
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We regret we unable to accept the LOU @ $60/- per day . 

  

We counter offer the LOU @$80/- per day (less than 3 months new car) X   09 days 

  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 6,848.00 
2. Loss of Use (9 days x $80.00) $    720.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $        2.00 

Total $ 7,570.00 

  

We would appreciates it if you could review this case more objectly and let us here from you urgently. 

  

Thank 

  

Best Regard 

  

Susan Low 

M/s SMC Auto Engineering Works 

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 

Tel: 6741 1731 

  

  

  

On Friday, 1 July 2022 at 12:03:20 pm SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:  

  

  

Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

We refer to the above matter. 
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We propose settlement as follows: - 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 6,848.00 
2. Loss of Use (9days x $60.00) $    540.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $        2.00 

Total $ 7,390.00 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole 
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, 
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 
terms/settlement.” 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Eng Pau Low <smc_eplow@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 30 June 2022 4:52 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Our Ref: SNE1985J220523 Your Ref: YM7313L 

  

  

Accident on   23/05/2022    Along   Defu Lane 9 Infront Of Unit 27A    Involving  SNE1985J   and   YM7313L 
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We refer to our attachment for your necessary attention and action. 

  

We have yet to receive your favourable response towards our client claims. 

  

Kindly let us hear from you in respect of our client's client ASAP 

  

Thank 

  

Best Regard 

  

Susan Low 

M/s SMC Auto Engineering Works 

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 

Tel: 6741 1731 

  

  

----- Forwarded message ----- 

From: Eng Pau Low <smc_eplow@yahoo.com.sg> 

To: mt_claim@lonpac.com <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Sent: Friday, 27 May 2022 at 04:06:35 pm SGT 

Subject: Request for 3rd party claims survey SNE1985J Claims against YM7313L 

  

Acident on  23/05/2022  Along    Defu Lane 9 Infront Of Unit 27A 

Involving   SNE1985J and  YM7313L     

  
We refer to the above accident and 3rd party claims. 

  

We hereby write to request of 3rd party claims pre-repair inspection for our client’s vehicle. 
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Please let us have your single joint expert motor surveyors list (SJE) to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to 
our client's vehicle jointly with our client/our motor workshop at No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 AutoBay @ Kaki 
Bukit Singapore 417883 as soon as possible. 

  

Kindly arrange. 

 
Thank you. 

  

Best Regard! 

  

Susan Low 

M/s SMC Auto Engineering Works 
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 417883 
Tel: 6741 1731 

  

  

Date of Survey:-                     _______________________________________ 

 
Name of Authorise Surveyor:-  _______________________________________ 

 
Surveyor Email:                      _______________________________________ 

 
Remark :-                              _______________________________________ 

  

  

  


