Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 10 June 2022 10:26 AM

To: ‘Wu Jinee'

Cc: ‘Jason'

Subject: RE: FASTECH REF: SJY 8317) DOA: 27.05.2022 YOUR REF: GBC 7825B // LKK Ref:
CC6/CTI122005020/Upa3

Attachments: GBC7825B Statement.jpeg

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Based on both parties report, your client was reversing into a parking lot while our insured passing by your client’s
vehicle. We are of the view that BOLA S24 is applicable, your client should exercise greater caution before reversing
into parking lot.

In view of this, we regret to inform you that we have our principal to deny liability and unbale to look into your
client’s claim.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 June 2022 2:08 PM

To: Wu lJinee <jinee.wu@fastechauto.com.sg>

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: FASTECH REF: SJY 8317) DOA: 27.05.2022 YOUR REF: GBC 7825B // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22005020/Upa3

Without Prejudice



Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.
We would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 June 2022 8:43 AM

To: Wu lJinee <jinee.wu@fastechauto.com.sg>

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: FASTECH REF: SJY 8317) DOA: 27.05.2022 YOUR REF: GBC 7825B // LKK Ref: CC6/CTI22005020/Upa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 07/06/2022.
We will look into the matter and get back to you.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Wu Jinee <jinee.wu@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 June 2022 5:40 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: FASTECH REF: SJY 8317J DOA: 27.05.2022 YOUR REF: GBC 7825B

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam,

Enclosed with the LOD documents to support the claim.
Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement as soon as possible.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Wu JinEe

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-46/48/50
Autobay Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520



