Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 4:00 PM

To: Keong

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; Emilaine Faune
Subject: Re: SMC2504E - After Paint Photo & Finalisation

Dear Keong,
Faiz Rosli is the officer-in-charge

AlIS ref no. 2022 22004895FR

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Keong <keong@successunited.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 3:55 pm

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Emilaine Faune
<emilaine@successunited.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SMC2504E - After Paint Photo & Finalisation

Hi Denise,
Ok confirmed L/S $3,800.00 with 5 repair days.

Kindly advise the officer in charge of this case in order for us to forward the necessary documents.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Teo Wee Keong
Claim Executive

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 / #02-29

Kaki Bukit AutoHub

Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515 Fax: 6748 5015

On Mon, 6 Jun 2022 at 15:48, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com> wrote:
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Dear Keong,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $3,800.00 before excess $1000/- with 5 days of repair,
subject to their approval.

Please acknowledge receipt of this message

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 3:25 pm

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>; 'Keong' <keong@successunited.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Emilaine Faune' <emilaine@successunited.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SMC2504E - After Paint Photo & Finalisation

Dear Keong,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $4300.00 before excess $1000/- with 5 days of repair,
subject to their approval.

Please acknowledge receipt of this message

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 9:50 am

To: 'Keong' <keong@successunited.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Emilaine Faune' <emilaine@successunited.com.sg>

Subject: FW: SMC2504E - After Paint Photo & Finalisation

Dear Keong,
Thank you for the email.
Dear Team,

FYNA. Thank you.



Note: With immediate effect 04/03/2022 Summer Lee(assignment Team) will no longer be in our company.
Please contact the undersign for survey arrangement.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Keong <keong@successunited.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 3 June 2022 5:32 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Emilaine Faune <emilaine@successunited.com.sg>
Subject: SMC2504E - After Paint Photo & Finalisation

Hi Yan,
Enclosed the above necessary documents for your reference.

Appreciate your prompt attention.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Teo Wee Keong
Claim Executive

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 / #02-29

Kaki Bukit AutoHub

Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515 Fax: 6748 5015



