Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 August 2022 1:27 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SLG 1995T Photos and Estimate, TP/ First Cap/SBS, DOA: 21.05.2022

From: Chia Sin Muk <em1lautopteltd@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 25 August 2022 1:26:29 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLG 1995T Photos and Estimate, TP/ First Cap/SBS, DOA: 21.05.2022

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Taufikh,
We confirmed COR Lump sum $2,800.00 + 4 days.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Karen, on behalf of,

Chia Sin Muk (Mr)

m: (65) 9666 6556 | o: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643
Co. / GST Registration Number: 201316380R

On Wed, 24 Aug 2022 at 23:39, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Mr Chia,

Please refer attached, COR I/s $2800 , 4 days.

Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Chia Sin Muk [mailto:em1lautopteltd@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 August 2022 1:17 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SLG 1995T Photos and Estimate, TP/ First Cap/SBS, DOA: 21.05.2022

1




WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We are unable to agree with your finalise amount, our calculation as follow :

Parts : $1,781.70 (2,375.60 - 25%)

SN :S$ 550.00

LB : $ 1,180.00 (You miss calculation on item Check Wiring as $3.00 instead of $30.00)
Total :$3,511.70 (3,511.70 - 20%)

Lump sum @ $2,800.00 (before GST) + 4 days

Our calculation on Parts price is based on the agent.
Item 1) Rear Bumper Assy is $626.70

Item 11) Rear Wheel Bearing With Hud LH is $914.20.

Kindly revert with confirmation of acceptance.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Karen, on behalf of,
Chia Sin Muk (Mr)

m: (65) 9666 6556 | 0: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643

Co. / GST Registration Number: 201316380R



On Tue, 2 Aug 2022 at 11:14, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Annie,

Please refer attached, COR I/s $2350, 4 days.

Subject to insurance approval.

Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Chia Sin Muk [mailto:em1lautopteltd@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 31 May 2022 2:50 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Team A

Subject: SLG 1995T Photos and Estimate, TP/ First Cap/SBS, DOA: 21.05.2022

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam

L/S Repair Cost $3,150.00+4 days.

Please find attachment, kindly check and finalise.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Annie, on behalf of,
Chia Sin Muk (Mr)



m: (65) 9666 6556 | 0: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643
Co. / GST Registration Number: 201316380R

Important: This email is confidential and may be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it and notify us immediately; you should not
copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Thank you.



