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Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 23 May 2022 9:36 AM
To: assignments; peggy.chan@awac.com
Cc: Reports (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: FW: Pre-Repair Survey Report of Vehicle SMT 8437L
Attachments: NSV2200008_TPV SMT 8437L.pdf

Importance: High

Dear Peggy, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
Dear Assignment Team, 
 
FYNA. 
 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Chan, Peggy <Peggy.Chan@awac.com>  
Sent: Saturday, 21 May 2022 11:08 PM 
To: Reports (LKKAuto) <report@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>; Chan, Peggy <Peggy.Chan@awac.com> 
Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Survey Report of Vehicle SMT 8437L 
Importance: High 
 
Hi Elaine 
 
We refer to the PRS survey conducted by your surveyor. 
 
We noted your surveyor’s recommendation that the repair would be in the region of $2,000 to $3,000 and estimated 4 working 
days for the repair period. 
 
The third party has submitted their claim with quantification and we noted the repair costs was $7,200 and their surveyor has 
recommended 7 working days for repairs. 
 
Attached is the survey report and repair invoice for your surveyor to conduct a paper re-adjustment.  
 
Please let us have the paper re-survey report soonest. Thanks. 
 
 
Regards 
Peggy Chan 
Assistant Vice President 
Asia Pacific Claims Group 
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Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd 
60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914 
T: +65 64230865 
F: +65 64230864 
E:  peggy.chan@awac.com 
W: www.awac.com 
 

From: Elaine (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 4 February 2022 5:25 PM 
To: Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com> 
Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto)' <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Pre-Repair Survey Report of Vehicle SMT 8437L 
 

CAUTION: External Email 

Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
 
Enclose Pre-Repair Survey Report of SMT 8437L. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Elaine | Reports 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 


