Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Creation Motor <creationmotor@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 8 July 2022 5:00 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Estimate FBH4530U

Yes, please proceed.

On 8 Jul 2022, at 12:52 PM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $1900/- with 4 days of repair, subject
to their approval.

Kindly acknowledge.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 June 2022 9:05 AM
To: creationmotor@gmail.com
Subject: FW: Estimate FBH4530U

Dear Sir,

Attach surveyor’s marking.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 8 June 2022 8:56 AM




To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Estimate FBH4530U

Attach marked estimate for FBH 4530U.

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@I|kkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 8 June 2022 8:15 am

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Fw: Estimate FBH4530U

From: Creation Motor <creationmotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 7:24 pm

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Estimate FBH4530U

<FBH 4530U MARK ESTIMATE.pdf>



