Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Monday, 26 September 2022 1:39 PM

Lim Chou Siong

CS A Team; Faeaz; Azman Bin Suip

RE: Il C/O LKK Submission of Third Party Direct Settlement, Y/R:
CC4/GRB22004829/ga3; O/R: SLX1342M

DV_SLX1342M.pdf

We confirm settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)

$8,651.52

2. Loss of Rental (7days x $100.00)(w/GST) S 749.00

Total | $9,400.52

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Lim Chou Siong <cslim@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 September 2022 2:16 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Faeaz <faesaz@honda.com.sg>; Azman Bin Suip <azmansuip@honda.com.sg>
Subject: Il C/O LKK Submission of Third Party Direct Settlement, Y/R: CC4/GRB22004829/ga3; O/R: SLX1342M

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Refer to our below email dated 15/9/22.



To date we still have yet to receive your response on the above claim settlement.

We appreciate if you could kindly expedite the process and let us have your settlement offer soonest
possible.

Warmest Regards,
Cslim

DID: +65 6514 5684
Email: cslim@honda.com.sg

From: Faeaz <faeaz@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 15 September 2022 1:51 pm

To: Hsiao Tong <chewht@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Lim Chou Siong <cslim@honda.com.sg>

Subject: FW: 1l C/O LKK Submission of Third Party Direct Settlement, Y/R: CC4/GRB22004829/ga3; O/R: SLX1342M

Dear Hsiao Tong,
As spoken to you earlier yesterday.
Appreciate if you could kindly assist to expedite on the above case.

Best Regards,

Mohd Faeaz
Snr. Executive
Ubi Bodyshop

Honda Singapore

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.

15, Ubi Road 4

DID/Mobile: 68465678 / 82886304
Web: www.honda.com.sg

N

From: Faeaz

Sent: Monday, 12 September 2022 3:44 pm

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; admin-a@lkkauto.com; motorclaim@iii.com.sg; Derrick Tan
<derricktan@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Lim Chou Siong <cslim@honda.com.sg>

Subject: FW: 1l C/O LKK Submission of Third Party Direct Settlement, Y/R: CC4/GRB22004829/ga3; O/R: SLX1342M

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We understand Cecilia is no longer working for your company.
Appreciate if you could kindly get any officer to look into the case below.

Best Regards,
Mohd Faeaz
Snr. Executive
Ubi Bodyshop

Honda Singapore



Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.

15, Ubi Road 4

DID/Mobile: 68465678 / 82886304
Web: www.honda.com.sg

.- You
=

From: Faeaz

Sent: Monday, 12 September 2022 3:10 pm

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>; motorclaim@iii.com.sg; Derrick Tan
<derricktan@iii.com.sg>; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Cc: Lim Chou Siong <cslim@honda.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Il C/O LKK Submission of Third Party Direct Settlement, Y/R: CC4/GRB22004829/ga3; O/R: SLX1342M

Dear Cecilia,

Refer to our below email dated 24/8/22.

To date we still have yet to receive your response on the above claim settlement.

We appreciate if you could kindly expedite the process and let us have your settlement offer soonest possible.

Best Regards,

Mohd Faeaz
Snr. Executive
Ubi Bodyshop

Honda Singapore

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.

15, Ubi Road 4

DID/Mobile: 68465678 / 82886304
Web: www.honda.com.sg

N

From: Faeaz

Sent: Wednesday, 24 August 2022 3:46 pm

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; motorclaim @iii.com.sg; Derrick Tan
<derricktan@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Lim Chou Siong <cslim@honda.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Il C/O LKK Submission of Third Party Direct Settlement, Y/R: CC4/GRB22004829/ga3; O/R: SLX1342M

Dear Cecilia,
Any update on the above claim settlement?

We appreciate if you could kindly expedite the process and let us have your settlement
offer soonest possible.

Best Regards,

Mohd Faeaz
Snr. Executive
Ubi Bodyshop

Honda Singapore

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.

15, Ubi Road 4

DID/Mobile: 68465678 / 82886304
Web: www.honda.com.sg




N

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 15 August 2022 2:28 pm

To: Faeaz <faeaz@honda.com.sg>; motorclaim@iii.com.sg; Derrick Tan <derricktan@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Lim Chou Siong <cslim@honda.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Il C/O LKK Submission of Third Party Direct Settlement, Y/R: CC4/GRB22004829/ga3; O/R: SLX1342M

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Hi Faeaz,
We are currently in the process of generating mandate report.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6749-4274 | HP: 8891 1278 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Faeaz <faesaz@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 August 2022 11:08 am

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; motorclaim @iii.com.sg; Derrick Tan
<derricktan@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Lim Chou Siong <cslim@honda.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Il C/O LKK Submission of Third Party Direct Settlement, Y/R: CC4/GRB22004829/ga3; O/R: SLX1342M

Dear Cecilia,

Refer to below email dated 4/7/22.

To date we still have yet to receive your response on the above claim settlement.

We appreciate if you could kindly expedite the process and let us have your settlement

Offer soonest possible.

Best Regards,

Mohd Faeaz



Snr. Executive
Ubi Bodyshop

Honda Singapore

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.

15, Ubi Road 4

DID/Mobile: 68465678 / 82886304
Web: www.honda.com.sg

N

From: Lim Chou Siong <cslim@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 4 July 2022 1:48 pm

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Faeaz <faesaz@honda.com.sg>; Azman Bin Suip <azmansuip@honda.com.sg>
Subject: Il C/O LKK Submission of Third Party Direct Settlement, Y/R: CC4/GRB22004829/ga3; O/R: SLX1342M

Dear Cecilia Chong,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX1342M AND SMP7992C ON 14.05.22.

Attached please find our repair invoice and other relevant documents for the direct settlement claim.
Kindly email me the DV as soon as possible.

Warmest Regards,

Cslim
DID: +65 6514 5684
Email: cslim@honda.com.sg

From: Printer Service <printservice@honda.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 4 July 2022 1:32 pm

To: Lim Chou Siong <cslim@honda.com.sg>
Subject: Attached Image

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.




Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.



