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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 26 August 2022 1:10 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team
Subject: 转发: RE : ALLIANZ - OD CLAIM - DESK TOP SURVEY - ABRAISCL2022-00002FR -

SLF3042K - FINALISE REPAIR

  

发件人: Accounts ( Ding Auto ) <accounts@dingauto.sg> 
已发送: 2022 年 8 月 26 日 13:09:14 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 
抄送: SA 0406 <sa0406@dingauto.sg>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Ding 
<kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg> 
主题: Re: RE : ALLIANZ - OD CLAIM - DESK TOP SURVEY - ABRAISCL2022-00002FR - SLF3042K - FINALISE REPAIR 

Dear Guo Qiang, 
 
We are agreeable to your finalize offer. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards,  
 

 
  

Lynn Yap 
Accounts Department 

 
Phone +65 6452 1208   
Web www.dingauto.sg | Email accounts@dingauto.sg  
176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 Singapore 575721 

 

 

 

Virus-free.www.avast.com 

 

On Fri, Aug 26, 2022 at 10:49 AM Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
Dear Henry,  
 
“Without Prejudice” 
 
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair $10250/- with 5 days of repair, subject to their approval. 
 
Regards, 
Guo Qiang 
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发件人: SA 0406 <sa0406@dingauto.sg> 
发送时间: 2022 年 7 月 7 日 11:57 
收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 
抄送: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Accounts ( Ding Auto ) <accounts@dingauto.sg> 
主题: RE : ALLIANZ - OD CLAIM - DESK TOP SURVEY - ABRAISCL2022-00002FR - SLF3042K - FINALISE REPAIR  
  

Dear Guo Qiang, 
 
Good day to you. 

 
Kindly refer to the attached supplementary list and photos after 
paint for   
your perusal and seek your approval. 
 
We would like to finalise L/S repair as below : 
 
Parts - $12662.10 
S/N - $100.00 
Labour - $2030.00 
 
Total : $14792.10 - 30% LS = $10354.47. 
 
Recommend repair - 5 days. 
 
Hope to hear from you soon. Thank you. 
 
Henry Lee 
Ding Auto Pte Ltd. 
 

 

Virus-free. www.avast.com  

 


