EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Lynn Khong <lynn.khong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 May 2023 12:42 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: SNM22D203534C02 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMY9559K & SHC813K ON

19.05.2022 ALONG STAMFORD ROAD *** LKK REF: CC3/CTI22004822/Gga3q2

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Mei Kwan,

Please proceed to DS with revised amount.

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair $ 7,070.13 $ 4,325. 88
(w/GST)
2. Loss of Rental $ 258. 94 $ 258.94 (2days x
(2days x $129.47) $129. 47)
3. LTA/ GIA Search $ 2.00 $ 2.00
Fee
$ 160. 00 $ 100. 00 (2days
4. Loss of Inome x $50. 00)
(2days x $80.00)
Total §  7,491.07 $ 4,686.82
Thank you
Regards,
Lynn Khong

Senior Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Tel: (65) 6389 6116 | F: (65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: & i Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.



From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 15, 2022 11:09 AM

To: Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM22D203534C02 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMY9559K & SHC813K ON 19.05.2022 ALONG STAMFORD
ROAD *** LKK REF: CC3/CT122004822/Gga3q2

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear So Chow,
Please see attached TP video footage.

For the PIR, CDGE was updated us that as stated in taxi driver police report, this is a non-injury hit and run case, may not
have investigation result.

Attached here with our email dated 06.07.2022.

For your approval/instruction please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 September 2022 1:42 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com>; Claims Dept
of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM22D203534C02 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMY9559K & SHC813K ON 19.05.2022 ALONG STAMFORD
ROAD

Hi Cecilia/Mei Kwan
We understand accident happened at midnight 0220hrs and police report was lodged by SHC813K.

Please assist to obtain video clip from taxi and police result.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.




Thanks and Best Regards

Chee So Chow
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Main: (65) 6389 6116 | F: (65) 6222 5879

Email : claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A 3EJfids Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any
copies of it thereafter.



