
1

Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 6 December 2022 9:44 AM
To: SUR; CS A Team
Subject: 转发: YP84C - CHECK & SUPP ITEMS

  

发件人: Ray <ray@procarcare.com.sg> 
已发送: 2022 年 12 月 6 日 9:44:03 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 
主题: RE: YP84C - CHECK & SUPP ITEMS 

Noted, thank you. 
  
Regards, 
  
Ray Lin 
Damage Assessment 
Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd 
Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716 
T: +65 6741 5336  |  F: +65 6741 7208 
E: claims@procarcare.com.sg  
W: www.procarcare.com.sg  
  

 
  
  
IMPORTANT NOTICE: The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended 
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately 
notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. 
  

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, November 28, 2022 9:54 AM 
To: Ray <ray@procarcare.com.sg> 
Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: 回复: YP84C - CHECK & SUPP ITEMS 
  
Hi Ray, 
  
“Without Prejudice” 
  
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair $23550 before GST/- with 12 days of repair, subject to their approval. 
  
Regards, 
Guo Qiang 
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发件人: Ray <ray@procarcare.com.sg> 
发送时间: 2022 年 11 月 8 日 17:06 
收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 
主题: FW: YP84C - CHECK & SUPP ITEMS  
  
Hi Guo Qiang,  
  
  
Please see attached. 
  
Regards, 
  
Ray Lin 
Damage Assessment 
Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd 
Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716 
T: +65 6741 5336  |  F: +65 6741 7208 
E: claims@procarcare.com.sg  
W: www.procarcare.com.sg  
  

 
  
  
IMPORTANT NOTICE: The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended 
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately 
notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. 
  

From: Ray  
Sent: Monday, August 22, 2022 4:46 PM 
To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: YP84C - TO FINALIZE  
  
Hi Guo Qiang, 
  
Please refer to finalize  
Total amount is $24046.44 
  
Regards, 
  
Ray Lin 
Damage Assessment 
Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd 
Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 #01-45/46 Singapore 408716 
T: +65 6741 5336  |  F: +65 6741 7208 
E: claims@procarcare.com.sg  
W: www.procarcare.com.sg  
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IMPORTANT NOTICE: The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended 
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately 
notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. 
  


