Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 19 May 2022 12:28 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; Karen Tan

Cc: King Auto

Subject: RE: OD SURVEY - YQ293K ACC REPORT // MSFC REF: D22001487MFCV/SBST/OD/KT

Attachments: MT00015139 is Approved (4.96 KB); MSA.pdf; 0. SC1K225C0002_12-05-2022_155615
(1).pdf

Dear Sirs,

Enclosed is our survey assignment.
Thank You.

Best Regards,
Harminder Kaur
Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
A Member of EEEEEH Insurance Group

36 Robinson Road, #16-01 City House, Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | Fax: 6507 3849 |Reg. No. 195000106C

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sqg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: King Auto <kingauto.sg@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 19 May 2022 11:37 am

To: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Linda Lee <linda@kingates.com>; Kingauto Administrator
<kingauto.clerk@gmail.com>; bencch@sbstransit.com.sg

Subject: Re: OD SURVEY - YQ293K ACC REPORT // MSFC REF: D22001487MFCV/SBST/OD/KT

Hi Ms Karen,
Our workshop located at Blk 3011 BEDOK industrial park E #01-2000.

Kindly arrange for surveying first while we awaiting parts cost from Mercedes’.

Best regards

Mr Jesper Wang
Operation Director
King Auto Group



From: King Auto <kingauto.sg@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 17, 2022 11:29 AM

To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: Ben Ching Chin Hong <bencch@sbstransit.com.sg>; LINDA LEE <kingauto.lindalee@gmail.com>;
Kingauto Administrator <kingauto.clerk@gmail.com>; Irene Lee <kingauto.irenelee @gmail.com>;
kennyyip@comfortdelgro.com.sg; daryltan@sbstransit.com.sg; gavinkhoo@sbstransit.com.sg; Henry
Kao <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: Re: YQ293K ACC REPORT

Ms Rachel,

Tks for the reply, | will email the quote to ms Karen for approval then. Any surveyor coming to take
photo? Vehicle is in workshop, parts already dismantled.

Best regards

Mr Jesper Wang
Operation Director
King Auto Group

From: King Auto <kingauto.sg@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, May 13, 2022 5:49 PM

To: Henry Kao <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Rachel Wu
<RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Ben Ching Chin Hong <bencch@sbstransit.com.sg>; LINDA LEE
<kingauto.lindalee@gmail.com>; Kingauto Administrator <kingauto.clerk@gmail.com>;
Irene Lee <kingauto.irenelee@gmail.com>; kennyyip@comfortdelgro.com.sg;
daryltan@sbstransit.com.sg; gavinkhoo@sbstransit.com.sg

Subject: Re: YQ293K ACC REPORT

Hi mr Henry
May | check is this vehicle YQ293K Sbst commercial vehicle covered under Ms capital?

If yes, May u send your surveyor down to assess the damage while we can submit direct
OD quote to u.

Best regards

Mr Jesper Wang
Operation Director
King Auto Group



