6/13/22, 9:16 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

OD SURVEY - YQ293K ACC REPORT // MSFC REF: D22001487MFCV/SBST/OD/KT

Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Mon 13/6/2022 9:08 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Dear Denise,
You may proceed with the repair at $5600.00 (before less $2000.00 excess).

Best Regards,

Karew Tan

Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3582 |
Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

AMember of IIRTENNE INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not
copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and

notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 8, 2022 10:44 PM

To: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Henry Kao <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Rachel Wu
<RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Linda Lee <kingauto.lindalee@gmail.com>; Irene Lee
<kingauto.irenelee@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: OD SURVEY - YQ293K ACC REPORT // MSFC REF: D22001487MFCV/SBST/OD/KT

Dear Sir/Madam,
Enclosed documents for your review
Please let us have your approval

Repair on part by part.

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: King Auto <kingauto.sg@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 June 2022 3:39 pm

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao
<HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Linda Lee
<kingauto.lindalee@gmail.com>; Irene Lee <kingauto.irenelee@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: OD SURVEY - YQ293K ACC REPORT // MSFC REF: D22001487MFCV/SBST/OD/KT

Hi Denise

Attached amended estimate.

Best regards
Mr Jesper Wang

Operation Director
King Auto Group

On 3 Jun 2022, at 08:51, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Jesper,

did you attach the correct estimate? vehicle number not tally

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: King Auto <kingauto.sg@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 2 June 2022 5:37 pm

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao
<HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Linda Lee
<kingauto.lindalee@gmail.com>; Irene Lee <kingauto.irenelee@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: OD SURVEY - YQ293K ACC REPORT // MSFC REF: D22001487MFCV/SBST/OD/KT
Hi all,

Attached estimate.
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Best regards
Mr Jesper Wang

Operation Director
King Auto Group

On 1 Jun 2022, at 15:35, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

Any update on the Estimate?

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Sent: Thursday, 19 May 2022 11:37 am

To: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Linda Lee
<linda@kingates.com>; Kingauto Administrator <kingauto.clerk@gmail.com>;
bencch@sbstransit.com.sg

Subject: Re: OD SURVEY - YQ293K ACC REPORT // MSFC REF:
D22001487MFCV/SBST/OD/KT

Hi Ms Karen,

Our workshop located at Blk 3011 BEDOK industrial park E #01-2000.

Kindly arrange for surveying first while we awaiting parts cost from Mercedes’.

Best regards

Mr Jesper Wang
Operation Director
King Auto Group

From: King Auto <kingauto.sg@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 17, 2022 11:29 AM

To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan
<karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Ben Ching Chin Hong <bencch@sbstransit.com.sg>; LINDA LEE
<kingauto.lindalee@gmail.com>; Kingauto Administrator
<kingauto.clerk@gmail.com>; Irene Lee
<kingauto.irenelee@gmail.com>; kennyyip@comfortdelgro.com.sg;
daryltan@sbstransit.com.sg; gavinkhoo@sbstransit.com.sg; Henry
Kao <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: Re: YQ293K ACC REPORT

Ms Rachel,

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAQKAGNIMTQ10DBhLTcONjYtINGE3OCO5NWVKLTMyZWUwMGFhNWIXNAAQAP9WghHjrGaQ8c6LTj7H4M4...

3/4


mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com
mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com
mailto:karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:linda@kingates.com
mailto:kingauto.clerk@gmail.com
mailto:bencch@sbstransit.com.sg
mailto:kingauto.sg@gmail.com
mailto:RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
mailto:bencch@sbstransit.com.sg
mailto:kingauto.lindalee@gmail.com
mailto:kingauto.clerk@gmail.com
mailto:kingauto.irenelee@gmail.com
mailto:kennyyip@comfortdelgro.com.sg
mailto:daryltan@sbstransit.com.sg
mailto:gavinkhoo@sbstransit.com.sg
mailto:HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg

6/13/22,9:17 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Tks for the reply, | will email the quote to ms Karen for approval then.
Any surveyor coming to take photo? Vehicle is in workshop, parts
already dismantled.

Best regards

Mr Jesper Wang
Operation Director
King Auto Group

Sent: Friday, May 13, 2022 5:49 PM

To: Henry Kao <HenryKao@mesfirstcapital.com.sg>;
Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Ben Ching Chin Hong <bencch@sbstransit.com.sg>;
LINDA LEE <kingauto.lindalee@gmail.com>; Kingauto
Administrator <kingauto.clerk@gmail.com>; Irene Lee
<kingauto.irenelee@gmail.com>;
kennyyip@comfortdelgro.com.sg;
daryltan@sbstransit.com.sg;
gavinkhoo@sbstransit.com.sg

Subject: Re: YQ293K ACC REPORT

Hi mr Henry

May | check is this vehicle YQ293K Sbst commercial
vehicle covered under Ms capital?

If yes, May u send your surveyor down to assess the
damage while we can submit direct OD quote to u.

Best regards

Mr Jesper Wang
Operation Director
King Auto Group
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