Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Sunday, 22 May 2022 2:39 PM

To: Chew Goon Motor; SUR

Subject: Vehicle number. SMJ2660A ; Acc date: 5/5/2022
Dear Kelly,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SMJ 2660A , Lump Sum Repair,
(Excess $500/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*QOur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chew Goon Motor [mailto:ad5@chewgoonmotor.com.sg]

Sent: Saturday, 21 May 2022 11:20 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Vehicle number. SMJ2660A ; Acc date: 5/5/2022

Dear Sir,

Kindly refer to the attached question mark photos.

Thanks & Regards,

Kelly

Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, AMK Ind Park 2A,
Ave 5 #01-15, 16 & 17,
AMK Autopoint



Singapore 568047
Tel : 6484 1626
Fax : 6484 0465

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 20 May 2022 16:24

To: Chew Goon Motor; SUR

Subject: RE: Vehicle number. SMJ2660A ; Acc date: 5/5/2022

Dear Kelly,

Attach marked estimate

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chew Goon Motor <ad5@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 20 May 2022 4:20 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Vehicle number. SMJ2660A ; Acc date: 5/5/2022

Dear Veron,

Sorry for disturb.
Can you send me the marking’s estimate first?

Thanks & Regards,

Kelly

Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, AMK Ind Park 2A,
Ave 5 #01-15, 16 & 17,
AMK Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465

From: Yan (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 18 May 2022 16:48

To: Chew Goon Motor; sur@Ilkkauto.com; 'assignments'
Subject: RE: SMJ2660A

Dear Kelly,

Received with thanks.



Note: With immediate effect 04/03/2022 Summer Lee(assignment Team) will no longer be in our company.
Please contact the undersign for survey arrangement.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chew Goon Motor <ad5@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 May 2022 4:40 PM

To: Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>; sur@Ikkauto.com; 'assighments' <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SMJ2660A

Dear Yan,

Kindly refer to the attached GIA.

Thanks & Regards,

Kelly

Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, AMK Ind Park 2A,
Ave 5 #01-15, 16 & 17,
AMK Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465

From: Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 18, 2022 4:33:10 PM

To: Chew Goon Motor <ad5@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>; sur@Ilkkauto.com <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'assighments’
<assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SMJ2660A

Dear Kelly,

Can send me GIA? Thanks

Note: With immediate effect 04/03/2022 Summer Lee(assignment Team) will no longer be in our company.
Please contact the undersign for survey arrangement.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chew Goon Motor <ad5@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 18 May 2022 4:08 PM




To: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SMJ2660A

Dear Sir / Madam,

Kindly refer to the attached.

Thanks & Regards,

Kelly

Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, AMK Ind Park 2A,
Ave 5 #01-15, 16 & 17,
AMK Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465



