Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Saturday, 23 July 2022 10:38 AM

To: Charn's Customcraft

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: GBL 3717 - Finalize

Attachments: GBL 3717 main estimate.pdf; GBL 3717 supp 1.pdf; GBL3717 SUPP 2.pdf; GBL3717
supp 3.pdf

Hi Rina,

Kindly refer our finalize $11,594.90 (P/P, before GST). 12 days.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 22 July 2022 1:05 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject:

Hi Steve

Please help to finalise the above vehicle.

Attached estimate and supplier bill for your retention

Thank you



Rina Clua
Chant's Customcraft«elk 1o,
Bulkcit Merah Lane 3, £01-105 (51159724

% B27L7054
= charns@ singnet.com.sg




