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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Thursday, 10 November 2022 3:44 PM
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: SNM22D203329/C02/PC7684A/TANCHC / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident 

Involving PC7684A (OI : CTI - TBA) and SHA4140C (TP : LKK REF - 
CC6/CTI22004539/ea3) on 12/05/2022

Hi Ezlyna, 
 
Please obtain VF from 3P before proceed DS. 
 
NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay 
is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email 
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Regards, 
Jacqueline Tan 
Senior Executive 
Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
Tel: (65) 6389 6116 |   F: (65) 6224 7175 
 
From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 10 November 2022 3:23 pm 
To: Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SNM22D203329/C02/PC7684A/TANCHC / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC7684A (OI : CTI - 
TBA) and SHA4140C (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22004539/ea3) on 12/05/2022 
 

 

Dear Jacqueline, 
 
We refer to your email below. 
 
Please find enclosed a copy of SHA4140C‘s GIA report.  Based on the taxi driver sketch plan & statement, taxi travelled 
the same direction as our insured’s driver. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  


