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FW: LKK Ref: CC4/III22004534/ga3 (SLT6139Y) Our Ref: SMR4084H DOA: 06/05/2022

Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>
Thu 8/9/2022 5:32 PM
To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

 

From: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 8 September 2022 5:30:38 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit
<kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>; Lauro Araos
Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: RE: LKK Ref: CC4/III22004534/ga3 (SLT6139Y) Our Ref: SMR4084H DOA: 06/05/2022


Dear Sir/Madam,
 
Kindly offer for settlement.
 
Appreciate.
 
 
Best Regards,
 
Loi Ai Ting
 
 

 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4556  •  F: +65 6565 1240  •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg
 

 
 
 
From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 

Sent: Monday, 15 August 2022 4:20 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;
Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Steve
Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LKK Ref: CC4/III22004534/ga3 (SLT6139Y) Our Ref: SMR4084H DOA: 06/05/2022
 
Dear Sir/Madam,
 
Pls. refer to attached amended LOD.
 
Our customer, NGO MIN YING insured with TOKIO MARINE claims as follows.
 
Cost of repair                     $ 6,647.91

http://www.cyclecarriage.com.sg/
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Loss of use                          $ 1,740.00   ($60.00 x 29 days)
GIA search fee                    $        7.45
                                              --------------
Total                                    $ 8,395.36
 
Appreciate if you could quantify your offer of settlement the soonest.
 
Thank you so much.
 
 
Best regards,
 
Larry Songcuan
Customer Service
 
 

 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4658  •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg
 

 
 
From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR 

Sent: 03 August 2022 03:33 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;
Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Steve
Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LKK Ref: CC4/III22004534/ga3 (SLT6139Y) Our Ref: SMR4084H DOA: 06/05/2022
 
Dear Sir/Madam,
 
Kindly ignore my email below for the reason that there is a dispute on COR.
 
We will send the adjusted LOD after re-finalize with Steve.
 
Thank you so much.
 
 
Best regards,
 
Larry Songcuan
Customer Service
 
 

 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4658  •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: 03 August 2022 02:18 PM

To: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;
Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;
Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LKK Ref: CC4/III22004534/ga3 (SLT6139Y) Our Ref: SMR4084H DOA: 06/05/2022
 

This email was sent from outside of your organisation

Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs,
 
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 03/08/2022.
 
We will look into the matter and get back to you.
 
Hi Cecilia,
 
FYNA, Thanks. CC4/GRB22004534/Ega3
 
 
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 

From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 3 August 2022 12:58 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;
Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;
Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: LKK Ref: CC4/III22004534/ga3 (SLT6139Y) Our Ref: SMR4084H DOA: 06/05/2022
 
Dear Ms. Chew,
 
Pls. refer to attached LOD.
 
Our customer, NGO MIN YING insured with TOKIO MARINE claims as follows.
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Cost of repair                     $ 7,058.79
Loss of use                          $ 1,740.00   ($60.00 x 29 days)
GIA search fee                    $        7.45
                                              --------------
Total                                    $ 8,806.24
 
Appreciate if you could quantify your offer of settlement the soonest.
 
Thank you so much.
 
 
Best regards,
 
Larry Songcuan
Customer Service
 
 

 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4658  •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg
 

 
 
From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: 03 August 2022 09:51 AM

To: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;
Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;
Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SMR4084H (MIT) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM (INDIA)
 

This email was sent from outside of your organisation

Hi Larry,
 
Finalize amount correct. Please proceed.
 
 
Thanks.
 
Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 August 2022 4:40 pm
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To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;
Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: SMR4084H (MIT) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM (INDIA)
 
Dear Steve,
 
Pls. refer to attached files.
 
Kindly confirm finalized amount of $ 6,597.00 before Gst.
 
Thank you so much.
 
Best regards,
 
Larry Songcuan
Customer Service
 
 

 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4658  •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg
 

 
 
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the
views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the
views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of
the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not
the intended recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify
us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of
the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any
of its related corporations.
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
14 May
2022
22:50

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> NGO MIN YING. Claimant's ID: -> SXXXX201H. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
14 May
2022
22:50

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(206073) MITSUBISHI ECLIPSE CROSS 1.5 CVT (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
14 May
2022
22:50

Clm Created
Reg No: SMR4084H. Acct Date: 2022/05/06. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: India International Insuran
ce Pte Ltd (HQ). TP Insurer: Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd (HQ). Workshop: Cycle & Carri
age Automotive Pte Ltd (Pandan Gardens)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
14 May
2022
22:50

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5
14 May
2022
22:50

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/05/25 [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

6
14 May
2022
22:50

Adj Mandate
Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

7
14 May
2022
22:50

Label Added (30651):Vehicle Not In,(30653):Direct Settlement. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

8
14 May
2022
22:50

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> CHEN TSUE YEE [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

9
30 May
2022
16:28

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:0.00:PODS Liability: 100%(B22) Remark: Insured driver collided onto third party parked
vehicle.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

10
30 May
2022
16:55

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/05/25 [I] Sherini

Pillai

11
30 May
2022
16:55

Adj Mandate
Set Approved:0.00. [I] Sherini

Pillai

12
13 Jun
2022
14:11

Label
Removed (30651):Vehicle Not In. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

13
08 Sep
2022
10:44

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

14
08 Sep
2022
10:44

Clm Dtl
Modified Insured Name: -> -. Insured ID: -> -. Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

15
08 Sep
2022
10:44

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2020/01/03.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

16
08 Sep
2022
10:44

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

17
27 Sep
2022
10:33

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:7135.36:PODS Liability: 100% *Quantum: (a)CORw/GST: $6,647.91 + (b)LOU(8days x
$60.00): $480.00 + (c)Search fee: $7.45 = Total: $7,135.36 *Vehicle Model: Mitsubishi Eclipse 1
499cc *3recommendation repair days + 5days(Waiting parts) = 8day

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

18
27 Sep
2022
12:24

Adj Mandate
Set Approved:7135.36. [I] Sherini

Pillai

19
03 Nov
2022
11:10

Adj Mandate
Request Cur.Req:7615.36:Pls refer to my email dated 03/11/2022 for details. Thanks [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

20
03 Nov
2022
14:33

Adj Mandate
Set Approved:7615.36. [I] Sherini

Pillai

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
No record

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2792980 17 May 2022
12:20:55

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

India
International
Insurance Pte

Ltd (HQ)

SMR4084H SLT6139Y 11.00

2840751 08 Sep 2022
10:44:49

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SMR4084H SLT6139Y 11.00
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