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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 6 June 2023 9:21 AM
To: Irene Tay
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: CTP REF NO. SNM22D203343C02 ----: Our Ref: GBC8051K20506   Your Ref: 

PA8146R *** LKK REF: CC6/CTI22004533/Upa3
Attachments: RE: SNM22D203343/C02/PA8146R/TAYHP / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident 

Involving PA8146R (OI : CTI - TBA) and GBC8051K (TP : LKK REF - 
CC6/CTI22004533/ea3) on 06/05/2022

Dear Irene, 
 
Noted. We will submit our report for your handling. 
 
Please note that we are still pending for our insured report.  
  
Hi HT, 
  
Kindly assist. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 6, 2023 9:09 AM 
To: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: CTP REF NO. SNM22D203343C02 ----: Our Ref: GBC8051K20506 Your Ref: PA8146R 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm (LKK), 
 
We refer to the above captioned matter. 
 
Please be inform that LIUS BROTHERS has just submitted their client’s LOD.  
 
Please advise whether are you still handling on our behalf if not I will takeover to negotiate. 
 
Regards, 
 
Irene Tay 
Claims Department (Motor Division) 
  
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 63896192   |   F:(65) 62247478/62247175 
   
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
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Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may 
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in 
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. 
Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 
 

From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>  
Sent: Friday, May 12, 2023 1:29 PM 
To: LKK - Asher Sng <ashersng@lkkauto.com>; LKK - Chew Hsiao Tong <chewht@lkkauto.com>; LKK - Admin A. 
<admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: Our Ref: GBC8051K20506 Your Ref: PA8146R 
 

 

We refer to our attachment for your necessary attention and action. 
 
We have yet to receive your favourable response towards our client claims. 
 
Kindly let us hear from you in respect of our client's client ASAP  

Thank. 

Best Regards, 

 

Susan Low 
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop  
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01  
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit  
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 67411730  
 

 
----- Forwarded message ----- 
From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com> 
To: LKK - Admin A. <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; LKK - Asher Sng <ashersng@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Sunday, 22 May 2022 at 09:07:20 pm SGT 
Subject: Our Ref: GBC8051K20506 Your Ref: PA8146R 
 
Accident on 06/05/2022 Along SLE Involving GBC8051K and PA8146R  

We refer to our attachment (LOD & Final Bill) for your necessary attention and action. 
 

Thank. 

Best Regards, 

 

Susan Low 
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop  
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01  

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit  
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 67411730 
 
 
----- Forwarded message ----- 
From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com> 
To: LKK - Admin A. <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Saturday, 14 May 2022, 12:00:55 pm SGT 
Subject: Request for 3rd party claims survey GBC8051K Claims against PA8146R 
 
 

Accident on 06/05/2022 Along SLE 

Involving GBC8051K and PA8146R  

 
We refer to the above accident and 3rd party claims. 
We hereby write to request of 3rd party claims pre-repair inspection for our client’s vehicle. 
 

Please let us have your single joint expert motor surveyors list (SJE) to conduct a pre-repair survey of 
the damage to our client's vehicle jointly with our client/our motor workshop at No. 1 Kaki Bukit 
Avenue 6 #01-01 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883 as soon as possible. 
 

Kindly arrange. 
 
Thank you. 
Best Regard! 
Susan Low 
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop 
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 417883 
Tel: 6741 1730 
Fax: 6744 5746 
 

 

Date of Survey:- _______________________________________ 
 
Name of Authorise Surveyor:- _______________________________________ 
 
Surveyor Email: _______________________________________ 
 
Remark :- _______________________________________ 
 

 


