




DISCHARGE VOUCHER  

  

Claim No. :  

  

Accident involving MID 20933 & YN4839B on 04/05/2022 

  
  

We, the Government of the Republic of Singapore as represented by the Ministry of Defence (the  

"Government") the owner of vehicle number MID 20933 hereby authorize LKK Auto Consultants Pte 

Ltd to act for us with respect to our claim, which includes settling and arranging all payments on our 

behalf for the losses arising from the accident.  

  

We acknowledge and agree that the payment by Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. of the sum of 

S$ 122.00 shall be the full and final settlement of all claims arising as a result of the  above mentioned 

accident.  

  

In consideration of the abovementioned payment by Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd., we hereby 

declare that we have no further claims against the owner or insurer of YN4839B & / or the  

Authorized Driver for the accident.  

  

We also authorised Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. to pay the full settlement sum to the 

Ministry of Defence (PS Defence).   

  

  

 

  

 Witness _______________________  _____________________________  

 Signature  Signature, on behalf of the Government  

                                                                                                      

  

  

 Name: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT   Name:  NORMAN TAN  

  

 Address:  MINISTRY OF DEFENCE / SAF        Address:  MINISTRY OF DEFENCE / SAF  

  

 NRIC No.: SXXXX245G  NRIC No.: SXXXX478C  

  

 Date: 02/05/23  Date:  
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT (MINDEF) <KANG_Wee_Huat_Edwin@defence.gov.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 28 February 2023 4:40 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF)
Cc: SHETH AADIT SACHIN (MINDEF); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: [Seek Mandate for Recovery Claim] - IOD:CY 22/MID20933/040522/0018 // LKK 

Ref: CC2/MIDA22004505/p]

Message Classification: Official Open  
Approved  
 
Sent from Outlook for Android 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, February 28, 2023 8:29:13 AM 
To: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF) <HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg>; EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT (MINDEF) 
<KANG_Wee_Huat_Edwin@defence.gov.sg> 
Cc: SHETH AADIT SACHIN (MINDEF) <Sheth_Aadit_Sachin@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) 
<olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [Seek Mandate for Recovery Claim] - IOD:CY 22/MID20933/040522/0018 // LKK Ref: 
CC2/MIDA22004505/p]  
  
Message Classification: Official Open  
Dear Sirs, 
  
Please be informed third party insurer had reviewed and revised offer at global sum of $122.00(all-in) towards our 
claim. 
  
The summary of claim is as follows: - 
  

  Our Claim Amount 1st offer from third 
party insurer 

2nd offer from third party 
insurer 

1. Cost of Repair (MID20933) $  159.62 $ 79.81 $122.00 
2. Insurer search fee $      2.00 $   2.00 

TOTAL $  161.62 $ 81.81 
  
Please confirm if SAF is agreeable to the offer of $122.00 from 3rd party insurer. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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From: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF) <HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg>  
Sent: Friday, November 25, 2022 3:18 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT (MINDEF) 
<KANG_Wee_Huat_Edwin@defence.gov.sg> 
Cc: SHETH AADIT SACHIN (MINDEF) <Sheth_Aadit_Sachin@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) 
<olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [Seek Mandate for Recovery Claim] - IOD:CY 22/MID20933/040522/0018 // LKK Ref: 
CC2/MIDA22004505/p] 
  
Message Classification: Official Open  
Hi Hisao Tong, 
  
I’m clarification with the workshop. Let me get back to you.  
  
Regards, 
  
      1WO DENNIS HO 
TA INVESTIGATION WO 
    HQ TPT/ SAFETY BR 
           63074511 
           91763064 
  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 24 November, 2022 9:40 AM 
To: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT (MINDEF) <KANG_Wee_Huat_Edwin@defence.gov.sg> 
Cc: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF) <HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg>; SHETH AADIT SACHIN (MINDEF) 
<Sheth_Aadit_Sachin@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [Seek Mandate for Recovery Claim] - IOD:CY 22/MID20933/040522/0018 // LKK Ref: 
CC2/MIDA22004505/p] 
  
Message Classification: Official Open  
Dear Sirs, 
  
Please be informed that 3rd party insurer Sompo has replied to SAF claim. 
  
With reference to damage photo, 3rd party insurer note that the damage is not serious but only the bent bar. They 
have clarified with their surveyor and the repair should only take 1 hour. 
  

 
  
  
- Cost of Repair : $ 79.81 ( $ 79.81 X 1 hr )  
- LTA  : $     2.00  
------------------------------- 
Total  : $ 81.81 
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Please confirm if SAF is agreeable to the offer of $81,81 from 3rd party insurer. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT (MINDEF) <KANG_Wee_Huat_Edwin@defence.gov.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 14 July 2022 12:41 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF) <HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg>; RISHABH RADHAKRISHNAN (MINDEF) 
<Rishabh_Radhakrishnan@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: [Seek Mandate for Recovery Claim] - IOD:CY 22/MID20933/040522/0018 // LKK Ref: 
CC2/MIDA22004505/p] 
  
Message Classification: Official Open  
Approved 
  
  
Get Outlook for Android 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, July 14, 2022 11:05:42 AM 
To: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT (MINDEF) <KANG_Wee_Huat_Edwin@defence.gov.sg> 
Cc: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF) <HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg>; RISHABH RADHAKRISHNAN (MINDEF) 
<Rishabh_Radhakrishnan@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [Seek Mandate for Recovery Claim] - IOD:CY 22/MID20933/040522/0018 // LKK Ref: 
CC2/MIDA22004505/p]  
  
Dear Maj Edwin, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
According to SAF’s accident report, the accident was caused by the negligence driving of civilian driver by coming 
out from minor road and collided onto MID20933. We are intending to submit recovery claim against the insurer of 
YN4839B, M/s Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.  
  
The summary of claim is as follows: - 
  

  Our Claim Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (MID20933) $  159.62 
2. Insurer search fee $      2.00 

TOTAL $  161.62 
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Enclosed herewith : - 
  

 MID20933 relevant documents. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval.  

Thank you. 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this 
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, 
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any 
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under  
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately  
if you receive this in error." 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this 
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, 
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any 
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under  
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately  
if you receive this in error." 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this 
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, 
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any 
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under  
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately  
if you receive this in error." 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 8 May 2023 10:39 AM
To: Gnoh, Pau Loong
Subject: RE: Claim No. CMTD2201516/GPL; RE: Recovery Claim For MID20933 // DOA: 

04/05/2022 // Sompo Insured: YN4839B
Attachments: DV_MID20933 LS Cleared.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
Please assist to send your payment via internet banking. The bank details are as follow:  
  
1.       Account Name:  Permanent Secretary (Defence) / Accountant General 
2.       Bank Name:  United Overseas Bank   
3.       Bank Branch:  UOB Main   
4.       Account No:  101-367-9377 
  
Please indicate CY 22/MID20933/040522/0018 as the reference for payment details and update us after payment 
had been processed. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Gnoh, Pau Loong <PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, March 20, 2023 1:24 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Claim No. CMTD2201516/GPL; RE: Recovery Claim For MID20933 // DOA: 04/05/2022 // Sompo 
Insured: YN4839B 
 
Dear Ms Chew, 
 
Thank you for your email and we enclose the Discharge Voucher for the agreed settlement at $ 122/- all in, for 
your client perusal. 
 
Please return the original signed DV and with the copy of the Authorisation To Act by email and advise who should 
this payment sum be pay to ? , thank you. 
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Best Regards 
Mr Gnoh Pau Loong 
Claims Division 
D: 6329 5217 | T: 6461 6555   
 
 

 
 

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.           
50 Raffles Place, #03-03, Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623 
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG  
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential 
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. 
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message. 
Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes 
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom 
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for 
our Privacy Policy. 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, March 20, 2023 9:57 AM 
To: Gnoh, Pau Loong <PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Claim No. CMTD2201516/GPL; RE: Recovery Claim For MID20933 // DOA: 04/05/2022 // Sompo 
Insured: YN4839B 
 

CAUTION:  This Email is from an EXTERNAL source. Ensure you trust this sender (Email) before replying or clicking on any 
links and open attachments. 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
We accept your offer. 
 
Please let us have DV. 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Gnoh, Pau Loong <PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, January 18, 2023 5:30 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Claim No. CMTD2201516/GPL; RE: Recovery Claim For MID20933 // DOA: 04/05/2022 // Sompo 
Insured: YN4839B 
 

Without Prejudice 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
With reference to your email below, purely to amicable settle and without admission of liability, 
we are prepared to meet halfway at the global sum $ 122/- all in. 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
 
Best Regards 
Mr Gnoh Pau Loong 
Claims Division 
D: 6329 5217 | T: 6461 6555   
 
 

 
 

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.           
50 Raffles Place, #03-03, Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623 
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG  
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential 
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. 
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message. 
Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes 
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom 
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for 
our Privacy Policy. 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, January 18, 2023 8:22 AM 
To: Gnoh, Pau Loong <PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Claim No. CMTD2201516/GPL; RE: Recovery Claim For MID20933 // DOA: 04/05/2022 // Sompo 
Insured: YN4839B 
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CAUTION:  This Email is from an EXTERNAL source. Ensure you trust this sender (Email) before replying or clicking on any 
links and open attachments. 

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We have checked with our principal and we regret to inform you that we are unable to accept your offer. Please be 
informed that the material of MID vehicle is harder/stronger than the common commercial vehicle. Therefore, the 
repair works need 2 hours. 
 
Please review and let us have your revise offer. 
 
Thanks. 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Gnoh, Pau Loong <PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 15 July 2022 4:30 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Claim No. CMTD2201516/GPL; RE: Recovery Claim For MID20933 // DOA: 04/05/2022 // Sompo 
Insured: YN4839B 
 

Without Prejudice 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
With reference to your email below, we note that the damage is not serious but only the bent bar. 
We have clarified with our surveyor and the repair should only take 1 hour. 

 
 
As such, for an amicable settlement and without admission of liability, we are prepared to settle your/your client's 
claim as follows:- 
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- Cost of Repair : $ 79.81 ( $ 79.81 X 1 hr )  
- LTA  : $     2.00  
------------------------------- 
Total  : $ 81.81 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
Best Regards 
Mr Gnoh Pau Loong 
Claims Division 
D: 6329 5217 | T: 6461 6555   
 
 

 
 

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.             
50 Raffles Place, #03-03, Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623 
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG  
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential 
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. 
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message. 
Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes 
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom 
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for 
our Privacy Policy. 
 

From: claimsreport <claimsreport@sompo.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, July 15, 2022 2:50 PM 
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Gnoh, Pau Loong <PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg> 
Subject: Claim No. CMTD2201516/GPL; RE: Recovery Claim For MID20933 // DOA: 04/05/2022 // Sompo Insured: 
YN4839B 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
We will direct your e-mail to the officer-in-charge, Mr Gnoh, Pau Loong, for his attention. 
 
 
Dear Pau Loong,  
 
For your attention and necessary action please. 

 
 
Best Regards 
Raba’ah Mohd Ali 
Claims Division 

 
Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. 
50 Raffles Place, #03-03 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623 
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG 
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Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain 
confidential and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be 
unlawful and is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message. 
Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for 
the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit 
bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting 
on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy. 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, July 15, 2022 10:45 AM 
To: claimsreport <claimsreport@sompo.com.sg> 
Subject: Recovery Claim For MID20933 // DOA: 04/05/2022 // Sompo Insured: YN4839B 
 

CAUTION:  This Email is from an EXTERNAL source. Ensure you trust this sender (Email) before replying or clicking on 
any links and open attachments. 

Your Ref: To be advised                                          Without Prejudice 
LKK Ref: CC2/MIDA22004505/p 
 
M/s Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID20933 & YN4839B ON 04/05/2022 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have been appointed by MINDEF as claims adjuster to handle all traffic accident claims involving military 
vehicles with effect from December 2021. 
 
We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured’s negligent driving and / or management of his 
vehicle. As a result of the accident, our principal’s vehicle was damaged and our principal has been put to loss and 
expense, particulars of which are as follows: - 
 

1. Cost of Repair $  159.62 
2. Insurer search Fee $      2.00 

TOTAL $ 161.62 
 
A copy of the supporting documents is enclosed. 
 
* Please be note that repairs of MINDEF vehicles involved in accidents are carried out by MINDEF list of appointed 
contractors or at the unit’s zonal workshops. There is no survey report of MINDEF vehicles. 
 
Kindly look into the above claim and let us have your cheque made payable to “PS DEFENCE” within the next 14 days 
from this letter. 
 
Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 



7/14/22, 10:39 AM Insurer Enquiry — GEARS

https://www.gears.com.sg/insurer-enquiry 1/1

INSURER ENQUIRY

Find
insurer
Vehicle reg. no.

YN4839B

Date of Accident

RESULT & RECEIPT

Payment details
Request Amount: S$1.87
GST Amount: S$0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive): S$2

General Insurance Association
Records Management Centre
GST Registration No: M400017735

04/05/2022

Reset

TP Insurer Enquiry

Insurance Sompo Insurance Singapore P…

Period of Insurance 27/01/2022 - 26/01/2023

Requested By Chew Hsiao Tong (National As…

Requested Date 14/07/2022 10:39

.........................................................................

.......................................................................

...............................................................

....................................................................................................




