Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 3 June 2022 12:19 PM

To: Mei Heng Kok

Subject: RE: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJJ 5330T(AIG) AND SHB

5105TAT/ALONG CTE TWDS CITY ON 07/05/2022

Hi Mdm Kok,
Thank you for your email.

As per our tele-conversation earlier, our surveyor who had conducted survey on third party vehicle will make
necessary adjustment based on damages consistency of damages. Please be assured that we will do our due
diligence to mitigate the cost.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

----- Original Message-----

From: Mei Heng Kok <kokmeiheng5330@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 June 2022 10:40 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJJ 5330T(AIG) AND SHB 5105TAT/ALONG CTE TWDS CITY ON
07/05/2022

Dear Ms Chew Hsiao Tong

Further to my earlier email of today’s date, | just want to emphasize that since the damage/ impact of the accident
was very minor, | hope they will not make us pay an unreasonable amount to settle the claim.

Please do your utmost to bring about an equitable settlement. Thank you.
Please ignore my previous incomplete email.
Best regard

Kok Mei Heng

Sent from my iPhone



