Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 July 2022 1:07 PM

To: 'Paul Ong Qing Yong'

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLF8836D Finalise
Attachments: SLF 8836 marking.jpg; 2491_001.pdf
Hi Paul,

COR $3003.94, 3 days.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Paul Ong Qing Yong [mailto:paul.ong@wearnes.com]
Sent: Friday, 8 July 2022 9:10 AM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Subject: SLF8836D Finalise

Hi,

Attached for closing
Paul Ong

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 8126 1237 D (65) 6378 9336
WEARNES

www.wearnesauto.com  paul.ong@wearnes.com
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