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Re: Estimate of SKZ 9542 B

Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Thu 7/7/2022 9:43 AM

To: fcautogarage pte ltd <fcautogarage@gmail.com>

1 attachments (1 MB)
SKZ 9542B FINALISED.pdf;

Hi Florence,
 
Refer to attachment.
 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of L/S $5,700.00 /- with 08 days of
repair, subject to their approval.
 

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

1Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

From: fcautogarage pte ltd <fcautogarage@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 11 June 2022 6:58 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Estimate of SKZ 9542 B
 
Dear Rasul,

This is after paint photos

On Sat, Jun 11, 2022 at 6:57 PM fcautogarage pte ltd <fcautogarage@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Rasul,


Kindly finalise this case for me


On Tue, May 24, 2022 at 1:57 PM fcautogarage pte ltd <fcautogarage@gmail.com> wrote:


Dear Rasul,

Kindly refer to the attachment and the triangle is Mr. Quoqiang's marking.

Thank you
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On Tue, May 17, 2022 at 8:41 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Florence,


refer to attachment for the revised estimate


Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

1Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 




From: fcautogarage pte ltd <fcautogarage@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 12 May 2022 11:42 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Estimate of SKZ 9542 B
 
Dear Rasul,


Kindly refer to the attachment


On Thu, May 12, 2022 at 11:33 AM fcautogarage pte ltd <fcautogarage@gmail.com> wrote:


Dear Sir,

Kindly refer to the attachment.


-- 

FC Auto Garage Pte Ltd
Florence Lee

Claim Officer
+65 90110243





-- 

FC Auto Garage Pte Ltd
Florence Lee

Claim Officer
+65 90110243

-- 

FC Auto Garage Pte Ltd
Florence Lee

Claim Officer
+65 90110243





-- 

FC Auto Garage Pte Ltd
Florence Lee
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Claim Officer
+65 90110243

-- 

FC Auto Garage Pte Ltd
Florence Lee

Claim Officer
+65 90110243


