Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 June 2022 16:32

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJQ 9872 H & SMT 6184 D ON 9 MAY 2022 - CALL FOR DIRECT
SETTLEMENT

Attachments: SJQ9872H_estimate_finalisation.pdf; SJIQ9872H_invoice.pdf; SIQ9872H_report.pdf;

SJQ9872H_rental_invoice.pdf, SMT6184D_ins_Search.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Your Ref:

Our Ref : SJQ 9872 H

7 June 2022

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM

8 Shenton Way (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#27-01 TO: Any Personal Injury
AXA Tower Claims)

Singapore 068811

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,

#02-25

Singapore 408933

Attn: Claims Department

Dear Sir/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJQ 9872 H & SMT 6184 D ON 9 MAY 2022 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Kindly find attached the finalized report for SJQ 9872 H, as proposed by our Single Joint Expert. We are pleased to inform
that we are agreeable to the amount proposed.

As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving SJQ 9872 H
& SMT 6184 D on 9 May 2022. We will like to know if your company is prepared to settle for the amount as stated
below:

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE) :$ 6,500.00
Cost of Rental $ 1,080.00
LTA Search $ 7.45



Total: : $7,587.45

We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the next 7
days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if required, so
that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.

We have also attached a copy of our company’s invoice for SJQ 9872 H, the Singapore Accident Statement of SJQ 9872
H, rental invoice and LTA search for your easy reference.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1% June 2019, we have shifted to and are now operating
from the following address:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, May 9, 2022 6:21 PM

To: do not reply <donotreply@axa.com.sg>; AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>;
customer.service@axa.com.sg <customer.service@axa.com.sg>

Cc: filenet-ctom-p-sg <filenet-ctom-p-sg@axa.com.hk>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJQ 9872 H & SMT 6184 D ON 9 MAY 2022 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT

Your Ref:
Our Ref: SJQ 9872 H

9 May 2022

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM

8 Shenton Way (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#27-01 TO: Any Personal Injury
AXA Tower Claims)

Singapore 068811

Attn: Claims Department Via Email

Dear Sir/Mdm,



¥ P

ASIA MOTORSPORTS SOLUTION PTE LTD
Speciatiss In salen of niow & reconditionsd bikee
Co. . s 20050758

G2 AUTO LEASING INVOICE NO: 2017/C396
DATE: 07/06/2022

VEHICLE NO: SJQ 9872 H

MAKE : TOYOTA ENGINE NO :2AZH309787
MODEL : PREVIA 8 SEATER  CHASSIS NO : JTEGD52M20A013483
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

Total lump sum repair including supply of parts and labour

Adjusted total lump sum repair costs $$6,500.00

- "Total amount payable 5%6,500.00

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd



K GAMBINO LEASING PTE LTD
215 UBI AVENUE 4 #01-00
INTERPID WAREHOUSE COMPLEX
S -408809

Mobile no: 93371048

UEN: 202210841M

GST REG NO: 202210841M

custom invoice temp No:

110/

Dated:

May 20, 2022

Terms of Payment:

Due upon receipt

Other Reference:

Customer Details

AHMAD AFFANDI BIN PARDI

BLK 687B WOODLANDS DRIVE 75 #07-41
Singapore 732687

Mobile no: 92327097

Email:
- Rate Amount Amount
S.No Description of Goods HSN/SAC (SGD) Qty (SGD) (SGD)
1 |SMN4059C Gambino 1,080.00 1 1,080.00 1,080.00

09 may - 18 May

1 1,080.00 1,080.00

Amount in words :
One Thousand Eighty Singapore Dollar (SGD)

Total ($) 1,080.00

PAYMENT DETAILS:

Company UEN: 202210841M

Declaration:

We declare that this custom invoice temp shows the
actual price of the goods described and that all particulars
are true and correct.

K GAMBINO LEASING PTE LTD

Authorized Signature
Billed by: QUE

Notes
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K. GAMBINO LEASING PTE. LTD.

Address: 215, Ubi Avenue 4, #00-00, Singapore 408809 ! Contact No: +65 9337 1048 / +68767 5136

UEN NO: 202210841M

LEASE AGREEMENT (CAIZES)
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> Back to OneMotoring

Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time :

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-220509-002640
Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference
No.

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SMT6184D
As at 09 May 2022/09:00:00
Insurance Co: AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - SMT6184D

Enquiry Fee

20220509151808013456

Sub-Total
Total Before Rounding
Rounding Difference

Total Amount Payable

Paid By
20220509151819112

Total
Cash Change
Tendered Amount

Excess Refundable Amount

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Amount
Before
GST (S$)

7.00

7.00
7.00

09 May 2022 / 15:18:58
Receipt Date/Time : 09 May 2022 / 15:18:58

GST
Amount

(S$)

0.49

0.49
0.49

Direct Debit: eNETS Debit
(Internet Banking)

Amount
After GST
(S$)

7.49

7.49
7.49
0.04
7.45

7.45

7.45
0.00
7.45
0.00

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



