Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>

Sent: Monday, 27 March 2023 5:52 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] REQUEST FOR PRS - SLQ62P YOUR INSURED: SHD4442R DOA:
06.05.22 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM22004317/Kea3

Attachments: Invoice SLQ62P.pdf; receipt-20220506-123635.pdf; Car Rental.pdf; LOA.pdf

Dear Claims Team,
We refer to the above mentioned.

Attached is the repair invoice, LTA search receipt, car rental, LOA and below are the items our
client wish to claim from AXA.

1. Repair costs $10,800.00
2. Car rental 1,800.00
3. LTA search fee 7.45

$12,607.45

We look forward to an early settlement.

Warmest regards,
Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
82636295

On Tuesday, 7 March 2023 at 03:38:04 pm SGT, Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <meikwan @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

Hi HT,

Kindly assist.



