




MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER 
 
Policy No : DMHCSNW00004872100     Claim No : SNM21D204262/C02/TANCHC 
 
Claimant  : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD 
 
Amount    : S$1,090.00 

SINGAPORE DOLLARS ONE THOUSAND AND NINETY ONLY 
 
I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid to me/us in full & 
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages 
sustained by me/us through an accident involving 
 
Claimant Vehicle No. : SHC 3782X 
Insured Vehicle No.  : SML 4622L 
 
Date of Loss         : 30/07/2021 
Place of Accident    : PARKWAY PARADE, TAXI PICK UP AND DROP OFF POINT 
 
IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforementioned sum by 
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely to 
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or 
 
Insured Name         : HAIRUL NIZAR BIN SANEP 
Driver Name          : HAIRUL NIZAR BIN SANEP 
 
from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage 
sustained by me/us arising out of the said accident. 
 
I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the 
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. 
 
 
(1) Global Sum     S$ 1,090.00  
       ================== 

TOTAL . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . S$ 1,090.00 
       ================== 
 
 
 
 
Claimant Name : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD    NRIC No : 1XXXXX821R 
  
 
 
 
Signature : ________________________________    Date    : ______________ 
 CLAIMS DEPARTMENT

COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969

Please forward your payment to
COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

"The contents of this document apply to
vehicle damages only. All personal injuries
and damages arising therefrom are excluded
from the ambit and application of this document"

10.5.2022
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 4 October 2021 3:01 PM
To: bartman1807@gmail.com
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 4622L AND SHC 3782X ON 30/07/2021

Our Ref:  CC3/CTI21008172/R1ea3 
 
04 OCT 2021 
 
HAIRUL NIZAR BIN SANEP 
 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 4622L AND SHC 3782X ON 30/07/2021 
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the 
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized driver may 
not be absolved from blame for this accident. 
 
If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in 
writing within the next 10 day, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without 
prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party’s 
insurer arising from this particular accident. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 
 
Asher 
Case Handler 
HP: 88399816 
Email: ashersng@lkkauto.com 
 
 
c.c.         China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd          
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Monday, 9 May 2022 12:27
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 4622L AND SHC 3782X ON 

30/07/2021 - SNM21D204262/C02/TANCHC

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Asher, 

Please proceed settle with breakdown amount not exceeding $1,098.94. 

Thank you. 

** Note: Please cc to claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com when you reply to us. 

NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay 
is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email 
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Regards, 
Jacqueline Tan 
Senior Executive 
Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6185 | Tel: (65) 6389 6116 |   F: (65) 6224 7175 

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any 
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify 
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 

 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 5 May 2022 10:15 AM 
To: Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 4622L AND SHC 3782X ON 30/07/2021 - 
SNM21D204262/C02/TANCHC 
 
 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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Your ref : SNM21D204262/C02/TANCHC 
 
Dear Sirs, 
  
We refer to the email below. 
 
Third party appeal on the rejection as insured have successfully claimed 50% from third party insurance. 
 
Enclosed a copy of third party email and DV for your review. 
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer " COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" at $1,100.00 (all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
  
  Amount Claimed Amount Revised   
1. Cost of Repairs (with GST) $   2,630.36 $ 1,493.12   
2. Loss of Rental (5days x $125.19) $     625.95 $    500.76 (4days x $125.19) 
3. Loss of Income (5days x $80) $     400.00 $    200.00 (4days x $50) 
 Sub Total: $ 2,193.88  
 50% :$ 1,096.94  
4. LTA Search Fee $           2.00 $         2.00   

Total$  3,658.31 $ 1,098.94 ~ $1,100.00   
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 05/05/2022 is only for mandate purpose 
 
For your approval please. 
 
Thank You.  
 
Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Tan Chew Chik Jacqueline <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 8 February 2022 12:44 PM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 4622L AND SHC 3782X ON 30/07/2021 - SNM21D204262/C02/TANCHC 
 
Hi Asher, 
 
Please submit your proposal for our approval. 



3

 
Thank you. 

 

** Note: Please cc to claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com when you reply to us. 

NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay 
is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email 
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Regards, 
Jacqueline Tan 
Senior Executive 
Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6185 | Tel: (65) 6389 6116 |   F: (65) 6224 7175 

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any 
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify 
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 7 February 2022 2:13 PM 
To: Tan Chew Chik Jacqueline <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 4622L AND SHC 3782X ON 30/07/2021 - SNM21D204262/C02/TANCHC 
 

 

Hi Jacqueline, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Third party appeal on the rejection as insured have successfully claimed 50% from third party insurance. 
 
Enclosed a copy of third party email and DV for your review. 
 
Kindly let us have your instruction if any. 
 
 
Thank You.  
 
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Tan Chew Chik Jacqueline <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 7 October 2021 12:49 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 4622L AND SHC 3782X ON 30/07/2021 - SNM21D204262/C02/TANCHC 
 

Hi Asher, 

The video clearly shows OI was moving within his OWN lane but not moved off from stationary position as 
alleged. The accident would not have happened if the taxi driver waited patiently and travel behind our 
insured.  

We maintain that our insured shall not be liable for causing the accident. 

 

** Note: Please cc to claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com when you reply to us. 

NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be 
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com 
or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Regards, 
Jacqueline Tan 
Senior Executive 
Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6185 | Tel: (65) 6389 6116 |   F: (65) 6225 5879 

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
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Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any 
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify 
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 7 October 2021 12:18 PM 
To: Tan Chew Chik Jacqueline <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 4622L AND SHC 3782X ON 30/07/2021 - SNM21D204262/C02/TANCHC 
 

 

Hi Jacueline, 
 
We refer to the email below. 
 
Third party disagreed with the rejection, enclosed the email from third party for your easy reference. 
 
Please be informed that we are currently deployed to work from home in view of the current COVID-19 situation may reach me 
at 8839 9816 for any urgent matters. 
 
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Tan Chew Chik Jacqueline <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 6 October 2021 10:28 AM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 4622L AND SHC 3782X ON 30/07/2021 - SNM21D204262/C02/TANCHC 
 

Hi Asher, 

We are not agreeable with your view. 

Based on the video footage, it was clearly seen that our insured was moving slowly within his own lane and 
the third party was straddling in between the lane. 

The third party should keep a proper lookout and change lanes only when it is safe to do so. 

Hence, please reject the Third Party claim. 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  



6

** Note: Please cc to claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com when you reply to us. 

NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be 
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com 
or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Regards, 
Jacqueline Tan 
Senior Executive 
Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6185 | Tel: (65) 6389 6116 |   F: (65) 6225 5879 

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any 
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify 
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 5 October 2021 1:02 PM 
To: Tan Chew Chik Jacqueline <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 4622L AND SHC 3782X ON 30/07/2021 - SNM21D204262/C02/TANCHC 
 

 

Hi Jacqueline, 
 
We refer to the email below. 
 
Enclosed a copy of the third party video footage for your easy reference. 
 
Basing on both party video footage third party was traveling straight to overtake all the parking vehicle along both side 
of the road. 
 
Before third party pass by your vehicle, your vehicle is still on hazel light and stationary on the side of the road. 
 
Vehicle that is moving off need to keep a proper look out for any oncoming vehicle. 
 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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Therefore we are of the opinon that the liability is not in our favour. 
 
 
Please be informed that we are currently deployed to work from home in view of the current COVID-19 situation may reach me 
at 8839 9816 for any urgent matters. 
 
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Tan Chew Chik Jacqueline <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 5 October 2021 12:57 PM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Hairul Nizar Bart <bartman1807@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 4622L AND SHC 3782X ON 30/07/2021 - SNM21D204262/C02/TANCHC 
 
Hi Asher, 

Enclosed video footage & scene photos from Insured for your perusal. 
 
Kindly get video footage from third part claimant at the same time for our further consideration. 
 
Thank you. 

** Note: Please cc to claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com when you reply to us. 

NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be 
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com 
or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
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Regards, 
Jacqueline Tan 
Senior Executive 
Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6185 | Tel: (65) 6389 6116 |   F: (65) 6225 5879 

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any 
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify 
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 

 

From: Hairul Nizar Bart <bartman1807@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 5 October 2021 12:41 PM 
To: Tan Chew Chik Jacqueline <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: Fwd: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 4622L AND SHC 3782X ON 30/07/2021 
 

 

Hi Jacqueline,  
 
This is the email that she send to me yesterday. 
 
For your ref, thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Hairul Nizar  
 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Date: Mon, 4 Oct 2021, 15:01 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 4622L AND SHC 3782X ON 30/07/2021 
To: bartman1807@gmail.com <bartman1807@gmail.com> 
 

Our Ref:  CC3/CTI21008172/R1ea3 

04 OCT 2021 

HAIRUL NIZAR BIN SANEP 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 4622L AND SHC 3782X ON 30/07/2021 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim 
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized driver may not 
be absolved from blame for this accident. 

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in 
writing within the next 10 day, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice 
basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party’s insurer 
arising from this particular accident. 

Please call us if you have further queries. 

Yours faithfully, 

Asher 

Case Handler 

HP: 88399816 

Email: ashersng@lkkauto.com 

  

c.c.         China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd          

            (Motor Claims Dept) 

  


