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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 July 2022 12:54 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: FINALISE Re: MT/1171307-002- Accident involving GBJ3098Y / GBE5109M on 4 

May 2022

  

From: wah hong motors & credit pte ltd <motor@wahhong.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 6 July 2022 12:53:50 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: FINALISE Re: MT/1171307-002- Accident involving GBJ3098Y / GBE5109M on 4 May 2022 

Hi Rasul, 

 

We agree with your finalize amount. Good day. 

 

On 06-Jul-22 12:46 PM, Rasul (LKKAuto) wrote: 

Hi Jimmy, 
  

Refer to attachment. 

  

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of L/S $10,400.00 /- with 

12 days of repair, subject to their approval. 

  

Kindly acknowledge 

 

 
Best Regards,  
Rasul | Assessor  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct  
file and location.

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

 
From: Wah Hong <motor@wahhong.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 23 June 2022 2:04 pm 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FINALISE Re: MT/1171307-002- Accident involving GBJ3098Y / GBE5109M on 4 May 2022  

  

Hi Rasul, 

Attached are the 34 after paint photos for your kind perusal. Kindly finalise with us. 
Thank You and Best Regards, 

 

Jimmy 

WAH HONG MOTORS & CREDIT PTE LTD 

ROC:199806235M 

 

ENTERPRISE HUB 

38 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST 
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#01-57 S(608581) 

 

Tel: (65) 6773 7377 

HP: (65) 8778 4848 

Website: www.wahhong.sg 

Mail: motor@wahhong.sg 

 

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE: The information contained in this email is intended 

only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain 

information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure 

under applicable law.  

If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are 

hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this 

communication is strictly prohibited.  

If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the 

sender and delete the mail. 

 

Data Privacy Policy Notice: Wah Hong Motor & Credit Pte. Ltd. may collect, 

use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy 

Policy.  

This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit 

bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our 

third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). 

On 30-May-22 9:37 AM, Cynthia Ang wrote: 

Classification: Restricted  

  

'WITHOUT PREJUDICE' 

  

Dear Jimmy, 

  

Liability is in your client’s favor.  Do note that repair of your client’s vehicle is subject 

to my surveyor’s recommendation and repair duration include Saturdays.    

  

When the repair is completed, you may email mtcl@income.com.sg  with your 

complete set of claim document for us to compute your claim. 

  

We will follow up with a letter of offer upon receipt of your final repair bill and 

other supporting documents on the quantum. 

  

With Regards 

  

Cynthia Ang 

Claims Executive  
Operations, Motor & Personal Lines  
T: +65 6430 7892 
  

 

PLEASE CONSIDER OUR ENVIRONMENT BEFORE YOU PRINT THIS EMAIL... 

  

 
Disclaimer  

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for 

the use of the recipient(s) named above. If you have received this message in error, 

please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it. Thank you. 
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