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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 June 2022 16:24
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMJ 3881 Y & SMC 7733 C ON 5 MAY 2022 - CALL FOR DIRECT 

SETTLEMENT 
Attachments: SMJ3881Y_estimate_finalisation.pdf; SMJ3881Y_invoice.pdf; 

SMJ3881Y_rental_invoice.pdf; SMJ3881Y__report.pdf; SMC7733C_ins_search.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Our Ref : SMJ 3881 Y  

 

7 June 2022  

 

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd                            PROPERTY CLAIM 
8 Shenton Way                                                                  (WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
#27-01                                                                              TO: Any Personal Injury 
AXA Tower                                                                         Claims)  

Singapore 068811  

 

Attn: Claims Department  

 

Dear Sir/Mdm,  

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMJ 3881 Y & SMC 7733 C ON 5 MAY 2022 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT  

 

Kindly find attached the finalized report for SMJ 3881 Y, as proposed by our Single Joint Expert. We are pleased to inform 
that we are agreeable to the amount proposed.  
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As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving SMJ 3881 Y 
& SMC 7733 C on 5 May 2022.  We will like to know if your company is prepared to settle for the amount as stated 
below:  

   

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE)                    : $   3,800.00  

Cost of Rental                                                                             :$   600.00  

LTA Search                                                                   :  $       7.45  

   

Total:                                                                          :  $ 4,407.45  

   

We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the next 7 
days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if required, so 
that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.  

   

We have also attached a copy of our company’s invoice for SMJ 3881 Y, the Singapore Accident Statement of SMJ 3881 
Y, rental invoice and LTA search for your easy reference.  

  

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1st June 2019, we have shifted to and are now operating 
from the following address:  
  
37A Everitt Road  
Singapore 428586  
  
Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above.  

  

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.  

   

Regards,  

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd  

37A Everitt Road  

Singapore 428586  





18.07.22

100.006 100.00









Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701
GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 06 May 2022 / 18:50:20
Receipt Date/Time : 06 May 2022 / 18:50:20

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-220506-003738

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/

Business Transaction Reference
No.

Amount
Before 


GST (S$)

GST
Amount

(S$)

Amount
After GST

(S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SMC7733C

As at 05 May 2022/10:25:00

Insurance Co: AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - SMC7733C


Enquiry Fee  

20220506184842995502

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49

Rounding Difference 0.04

Total Amount Payable 7.45
 

Paid By

20220506184857282 Direct Debit: eNETS Debit
(Internet Banking)

7.45


Total 7.45

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 7.45

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

 

 

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

 

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.
 

> Back to OneMotoring
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 16 June 2022 11:51
To: STEVENLOKE@SMCSING.COM.SG
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC 7733C AND SMJ 3881Y ALONG 106 TOWNER ROAD CAR 

PARK SINGAPORE ON 05/05/2022

16 June 2022  
 
SMC CORPORATION (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD 
 
Dear Sir/ Mdm 
  
OUR REF       : CC4/ASM22004281/Uea3 
YOUR REF     : SMC 7733C 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC 7733C AND SMJ 3881Y ALONG 106 TOWNER ROAD CAR PARK SINGAPORE ON 05/05/2022 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.  
 
We have received a claim from M/s TP WSP acting on behalf of the owner of SMJ 3881Y against your motor insurance 
policy. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had reversed and hit Third Party 
vehicle SMJ 3881Y. As such, liability is down against us. 
 
Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy. 
 
We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded under 
the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of  
third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the 
date of this letter.  Your intent must be formally expressed to us and acknowledged by us.  
 
Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to ashersng@lkkauto.com 
within 7 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and 
further document may be required: 

 Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any) 
 Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any) 
 Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any) 
 Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any) 
 Video footage of accident (if any) 
 Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any) 
 If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep us 

informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim 
 
To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s) 
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AXA’s prior knowledge and consent.  
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This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of 
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.  
 
In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the final 
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).   
 
If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us at ashersng@lkkauto.com.  
 
Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
Asher Sng 
Case Handler 
DID: 6841 6051 
Email: ashersng@lkkauto.com 
c.c.      AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (AXA) 
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 17 June 2022 10:46
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: New message for service request 260225, vehicle number SMJ3881Y

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

16/6/22 5:39 PM              ***  
Hi Hsiao Tong, Pls proceed DS. Thanks - HO Winnie 
 

Begin forwarded message: 
 
From: vale.oh@axa.com.sg 
Subject: New message for service request 260225, vehicle number SMJ3881Y 
Date: 17 June 2022 at 10:22:07 AM GMT+8 
To: admin-d@lkkauto.com 
 
AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S2M040DC. 
Please click here https://vendor.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/ClaimApplication/dist/html/index-vendor.html 
to view the message in Vendor Portal. 
 
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by  
AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any  
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is  
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify  
the sender immediately. 

 


