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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg>
Sent: Friday, September 30, 2022 9:39 AM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: ACCD INLVG GBH9764D AND SMP6059D ON 07/05/2022 *** LKK REF: 

CC6/AIG22004280/Uga3
Attachments: SKMBT_C224e22093008530.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: HMK

Dear Mei Kwan 
 
Attach DV. 
 
 
REGARDS 
 
PEGGY FOO 
NPH AUTO SERVICE 
TEL: 67840663 
EMAIL: peggy@nphauto.com 
 
 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 29 September 2022 1:17 PM 
To: Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCD INLVG GBH9764D AND SMP6059D ON 07/05/2022 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG22004280/Uga3  
 

Dear Peggy, 

Thank you for your acceptance. 

Kindly chop & sign the enclosed DV and return via email for our necessary action. 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 29 September 2022 1:00 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCD INLVG GBH9764D AND SMP6059D ON 07/05/2022 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG22004280/Uga3  
 
Dear Mei Kwan 
 
We prepare to accept your offer $8,090.00. 
 
 
REGARDS 
 
PEGGY FOO 
NPH AUTO SERVICE 
TEL: 67840663 
EMAIL: peggy@nphauto.com 
 
 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 29 September 2022 10:41 AM 
To: nphauto@pacific.net.sg 
Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCD INLVG GBH9764D AND SMP6059D ON 07/05/2022 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG22004280/Uga3  
 
Dear Peggy, 
 
As spoken, AIG maintained LOR @ 6 days. 
 
Our principal propose settlement as follows: - 
                                                                                     

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $  7,490.00   
2. Loss of Rental (6days x $100) $     600.00   
Total:      $  8,090.00   

 
Kindly let us have your acceptance. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Peggy [mailto:nphauto@pacific.net.sg]  
Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 9:49 AM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: ACCD INLVG GBH9764D AND SMP6059D ON 07/05/2022 
 
Hi Asher 
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Please let us have your reply whether is approved. 
 
 
REGARDS 
 
PEGGY FOO 
NPH AUTO SERVICE 
TEL: 67840663 
EMAIL: peggy@nphauto.com 
 
 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 31 August 2022 2:25 PM 
To: Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg> 
Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCD INLVG GBH9764D AND SMP6059D ON 07/05/2022 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Hi Peggy, 
 
We refer to the email below. 
 
We will reseek the approval from our principal, shall revert to you once approved. 
 
Thank You.  
 

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 26 August 2022 14:36 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCD INLVG GBH9764D AND SMP6059D ON 07/05/2022 
 
Dear Asher 
 
The loss of rental should be 7 days and we only prepare to accept the offer for rental $700.00. 
 
The amount will be $8,190.00 
 
Please let us have your reply soon. 
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REGARDS 
 
PEGGY FOO 
NPH AUTO SERVICE 
TEL: 67840663 
EMAIL: peggy@nphauto.com 
 
 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 25 August 2022 5:51 PM 
To: nphauto@pacific.net.sg 
Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCD INLVG GBH9764D AND SMP6059D ON 07/05/2022 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Our principal propose settlement as follows: - 
                                                                                     

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $  7,490.00   
2. Loss of Rental (6days x $100) $     600.00   
Total:      $  8,090.00   

 
Kindly let us have your acceptance. 
 
Thank You.  
 

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 3 August 2022 1:52 pm 
To: Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg> 
Subject: RE: ACCD INLVG GBH9764D AND SMP6059D ON 07/05/2022 
 
Without prejudice 
 
Hi peggy,  
 
We are pending for mandate approval.  
 
Thanks  
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 

liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | HP: 8891 1278 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 3 August 2022 9:54 am 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: ACCD INLVG GBH9764D AND SMP6059D ON 07/05/2022 
 
 
 
 
Dear Cecilia 
 
We refer to our letter dated on 27/05/2022. 
 
To date we still have not received your reply to settle the claim. 
 
Please let us have your reply asap. 
 
 
REGARDS 
 
PEGGY FOO 
NPH AUTO SERVICE 
TEL: 67840663 
EMAIL: peggy@nphauto.com 
 
 
 
 

From: Peggy [mailto:nphauto@pacific.net.sg]  
Sent: Friday, 27 May 2022 10:56 AM 
To: 'Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)' <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCD INLVG GBH9764D AND SMP6059D ON 07/05/2022 
 
Dear Cecilia 
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We refer to the above matter and claiming against you as follows: 
 
Cost of repair                                                                                                     $7,490.00 
Rental                                                                                                                         840.00 
                                                                                                                                ------------ 
Total                                                                                                                      $8,330.00 
                                                                                                                                ======= 
 
Attach documents and please let us have your reply soon. 
 
 
REGARDS 
 
PEGGY FOO 
NPH AUTO SERVICE 
TEL: 67840663 
EMAIL: peggy@nphauto.com 
 
 


