Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Attachments:

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Friday, 13 May 2022 11:15 AM

Yong, Joanne-LF

AIG Ref: 5440617184SG // LKK Ref: CC6/AIG22004198/Upa3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SMF 685M AND YQ 4277G ON 22/04/2022]

Accident on 22/04/2022 Along Jurong West Avenue 2 Involving YQ4277G &
SMF685M; FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF 685M AND YQ 4277G ON 22/04/2022
14:40 ALONG/AT JURONG WEST AVE 2

Please be informed that Ol & TP reached mutual settlement. Kindly refer to the attached email for you easy

reference.

In view of this, we will proceed to close file and submit WP report to your good office.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 May 2022 12:05 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF 685M AND YQ 4277G ON 22/04/2022 14:40
ALONG/AT JURONG WEST AVE 2

Attachments: 20220511_212617.jpg

Hi

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Tan Phuay Heng <tph1329@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 12 May, 2022 11:08 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF 685M AND YQ 4277G ON 22/04/2022 14:40 ALONG/AT JURONG WEST AVE
2

Hi,

| have a signed agreement with the driver of YQ4277G to settle the damage if any on our own. Please see attached
for the document.

Kindly advise if anymore action is needed. Will appreciate if u can call me at 94576745.
Regards

On Wed, 11 May 2022, 14:12 Mei Kwan (LKKAuto), <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Our Ref: CC6/A1G22004198/Upa3

AIG Ref: 5440617184SG

Tan Phuay Heng (Chen Peixing)
541 Jurong West Avenue 1

#07-1048



SINGAPORE 640541

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF 685M AND YQ 4277G ON 22/04/2022 14:40 ALONG/AT JURONG
WEST AVE 2

We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd has been appointed to act on the behalf of your insurer, AlG Asia Pacific
Insurance Pte Ltd (AIG) to settle a THIRD-PARTY claim against you for an accident which happened on the above-
mentioned date and location.

Kindly proceed to lodge your GIA report within five (05) working days of receipt of this letter, giving the
version of the accident amongst other things related to the accident. The GIA report can be lodged at any of
AIG reporting centres. You may refer to your Certificate of Insurance for the list of the reporting centres.

If you have any information to add or any amendments to make, please contact the undersigned within five
days from the date of this letter.

Please note that the standing of your insurance policy such as NCD, premium & etc would be affected.

Yours faithfully,

Hsiao Tong
Claims

Tel : 6742 3197
Fax: 6741 4108

Email : chewht@lkkauto.com

c.c. Claims Manager



AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

(Motor Claims Dept)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 12 May 2022 4:03 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Marcus Chua (LKKAuto)

Cc: Liu's Bro - Jasmine

Subject: Accident on 22/04/2022 Along Jurong West Avenue 2 Involving YQ4277G &
SMF685M

Attachments: YQ4277G - PS - 22042022 jpg

We refer to the above accident .

Our client's GBL had just received the letter of mutual settlement for the above accident from their authorised driver
counter signed by both parties driver

Please ignore and close the case under "Mutual Settlement"

Sorry for the inconvenience caused.
Thank.

Best Regards,

Susan Low

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Tel: 67411730

----- Forwarded message -----

From: Jacqueline Han Kwee Ling <jacquelinehankl@gbl.com.sg>

To: 'Susan Low' <liusbro@ymail.com>; Jasmine Low <liusbrojasmine @ yahoo.com>
Sent: Thursday, 12 May 2022, 03:05:17 pm SGT

Subject: RE: FCI - YQ4277G (RR85 EXPRESS) DOA : 22/04/2022 - TP REPAIRS

Dear Susan,

Please refer attached PS from our hirer.

Thank you.

GOLD BELL Goldbell Leasing Pte Ltd

GOLDBELL L E |n| S‘ I N G

Industrial Vehicles. Financial Services. +65 6494 2817 | | f: +65 6864 0625 | w: www.goldbell.com.sg
41,000 Served. And Counting.

Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator

1



PLEASE BE REMINDED:

Using GOODS VEHICLE as a PUBLIC SERVICE VEHICLE
and COLLECTING FARE without an official licence
is NOT allowed by LTA. Thank you!

WE'RE MORE THAN JUST INDUSTRIAL VEHICLES.
WE'RE AN ECOSYSTEM THAT CONNECTS EVERYONE.

GOLDBELL

Lol
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