Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 17 June 2022 8:27 AM
To: SUR; CS A Team
Subject: FW: SFW 5148H

From: WeeKwan Chia <weekwanchia@yahoo.com>

Sent: Friday, 17 June 2022 8:26:51 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SFW 5148H

Ok confirm cost of repair at L/S $9,200.00 & 10 days,of repair.
Thank-you

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Thu, 16 Jun 2022 at 9:47, Rasul (LKKAuto)
<Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Chia,
Refer to attachment.

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of L/S $9,200.00 /- with 10 days of
repair, subject to their approval.

Kindy acknowledge

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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