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RE: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10015051/CD || OI-SMG6328A (WHITE) TP-SLU8425C ||
Est: $0.00 || Fastech Auto Pte Ltd

Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>
Thu 5/5/2022 11:29 AM
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>;Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>;SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>;assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Derrick Quok <derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>;Kenneth Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>;Charandeep Singh
<charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Dear Sir/Madam,
 
Thank you for the assignment.
 
 

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
 
 
From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 5 May 2022 11:23 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Derrick Quok <derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>;
Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10015051/CD || OI-SMG6328A (WHITE) TP-SLU8425C || Est: $0.00 ||
Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
 
Hi Team
 
We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: SLU8429C
 
Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-46/48/50
Autobay Singapore 417883
 
Tel: 6746 5405 / Shiying
 
Attached GIA reports.
 
 
Thank you.
 
Warmest Regards,
 
Shafawati Md Rabu
Admin Executive, Claims
 
T +65 6989 3697
F +65 6725 0853 
E shafawati.m@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore
239924                                                                                                                                
budgetdirect.com.sg
 

 
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as
Budget Direct Insurance.
 
From: Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 4 May 2022 3:53 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Ashley Chia <ashley.chia@fastechauto.com.sg>

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRI Request on 04/05/2022 || C10015051 || REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SLU 8425C DOA:
02.05.2022
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sir / Madam,

 
Please arrange (LKK) to conduct the pre- repair survey.
 

Thank You

 
 
 

Best Regards,
Shiying
Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-46/48/50
Autobay Singapore 417883
Tel: 6746 5405
Fax: 6745 8520
 
Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be
without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/ claimant.
 
 
From: Ashley Chia <ashley.chia@fastechauto.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 4 May 2022 11:16 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Ong Shiying <shiying.ong@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: REQUEST FOR PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SLU 8425C DOA: 02.05.2022
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Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sir / Madam,

 

Your insured’s vehicle: SMG 6328A.

 

Date of accident: 02/05/2022

 

Please arrange  Pre-repair Inspection for my client’s vehicle no: SLU 8425C.

 

In accordance to APPENDIX C Pre-action Protocol for Non-Injury Motor Accident Cases of

PRACTICE DIRECTIONS

AMENDMENT NO. 1 OF 2016 paragraph 2.3, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors

within 2 days of the notice.

 

 

Thank you

 
 
Best Regards,
Ashley Chia
Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-46/48/50
Autobay Singapore 417883
Tel: 6746 5405
Fax: 6745 8520
 
Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury

claim (if any) of the owner/ claimant. 

 
 
 


