Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 29 November 2022 4:13 PM

To: Boo seng yak

Cc: SUR; Carrine Leong; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing
Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SNC3726M - OD AIG - SURVEYED 29 APR 22
Dear Mr Boo,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer final fig $78,774.00 (as our principal approved $486/- for paint coating) before excess $100.00 & GST and 40
repair days.

Kindly check and confirm.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 4:30 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>;
jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: Re: FINAL REVISION - SNC3726M - OD AIG - SURVEYED 29 APR 22

Hi Shiau Chan and all,

Please find attached, owner's invoice and amended revised estimate for your attention.

Please take note of changes on owner's paint coating invoice, wrongly presented in my last revision.

Final repair cost should be $79,077.04

Errors regretted.

Best regards - Johnny Boo

On Fri, Nov 25, 2022 at 10:15 AM Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam,

Kindly provide us the paint coating supporting documents.



Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 14 November 2022 5:48 PM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@Ikkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg;
Chang Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SNC3726M - OD AIG - SURVEYED 29 APR 22

Hi Adrian and all,

Revised estimate, re-survey docs and photographs attached.

Pls confirm repair cost of $79,100.68 @ 50 days exclude Sundays & PH.

Your early closure is appreciated.

Best regards - Johnny Boo



