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Meng Yan

From: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Thursday, 28 April 2022 3:44 PM
To: Claims Dept of CTI; hamzah_saad@tanchong.com; sur@lkkauto.com; Nivitha (LKK Auto); 

'assignments'
Subject: RE: SNM22D202834/C01/SMF7919T/THAMYL / FW: SMF7919T - survey arrangement 

request.
Attachments: SATISFACTION VOUCHER.pdf; O/R: SNM22D202834/C01/SMF7919T/THAMYL / FW: 

SMF7919T - survey arrangeme.... (2.41 MB)

Hi Hamzah 
 
We will assign LKK to conduct survey 
 
Own damage excess : $500.00 
 
Please submit the following when complete:  
 

1. Completed China Taiping satisfaction voucher (Please feel in all the blanks). 
2. Supplier bill (if possible) 
3. Final invoice. 
4. After repair photographs. 

 
 
Hi LKK 
 
Please conduct OD survey 
 
 
Thanks. 
 
Pauline Tham 
Claims Department 
  
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6541   |   F: (65) 6224 7175 
   
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any 
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please 
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 
From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Thursday, April 28, 2022 2:26 PM 
To: hamzah_saad@tanchong.com; Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: O/R: SNM22D202834/C01/SMF7919T/THAMYL / FW: SMF7919T - survey arrangement request. 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
Kindly note case handler is Pauline Tham. 
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Dear Pauline, 
 
Fya. Od claim. 
 
 
 
NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be expected for 
handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made via emailor fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Thank you 
 
Chong Boon Sen 
Claims Department 
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909  
DID: (65) 63896116   |   F: (65) 62247175   
   

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential 
information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not 
the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 
 
From: Hamzah <hamzah_saad@tanchong.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 28 April 2022 11:46 AM 
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: SMF7919T - survey arrangement request. 
 

 

Dear Motor Claim Team, 
 
Kindly arrange for survey and pls let me know the date and timing. 
 
Regards. 
 
 

Hamzah Sa'ad 

Service Supervisor 

Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd 

19 Ubi Road 4  

Singapore 408623 

DID: +65 67038690 FAX: +65 68467483 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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Hp: +65 96450079  

Email: hamzah_saad@tanchong.com 

Website: www.nissan.com.sg 

 

 

 

Right-click here to download pictures.  To help p ro tect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 


