Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 April 2022 12:05 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Henry Kao; Esther Lim; Rachel Wu; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas
View Circuit on 23 February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle
Policies)

MSFCIL Refs:

D17003681MFVS/EL/TRC1879X
D17003682MFVS/EL/TRD3409B
D17003683MFVS/RW/TRB4306T
D17003684MFVS/EL/TRD2789K
D17003685MFVS/EL/TRD2809L
D17003686MFVS/VS/TRD2851M

Dear Asher,

We refer further to the below email.

Kindly advise update.

We hope to receive the reports before the end of this week.
Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877

| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 | Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No.
195000106C

A Member of EIEEENH Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sq for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 April 2022 2:07 pm

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Henry Kao <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Esther Lim <EstherLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Rachel Wu
<RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit on 23
February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Hi Vic,



We refer to the email below.
We will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 April 2022 09:06

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Henry Kao <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Esther Lim <EstherLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Rachel Wu
<RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit on 23
February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

MSFCIL Refs:
D17003681MFVS/EL/TRC1879X
D17003682MFVS/EL/TRD3409B
D17003683MFVS/RW/TRB4306T
D17003684MFVS/EL/TRD2789K
D17003685MFVS/EL/TRD2809L
D17003686MFVS/VS/TRD2851M

Dear Asher,
We refer further to our below email and to our previous telephone conversation.

As spoken, kindly furnish us the valuation report for each trailer, to determine the depreciation value to be based on
the purchase costs (as per attached documents) and the life span of each trailer.

We hope to hear and receive the report from you the soonest for our needful action.
Thank you.
Kind Regards,

Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877

| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 | Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No.
195000106C

A Member of LAELEI Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):



Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sq for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan

Sent: Monday, 18 April 2022 9:59 am

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Henry Kao <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit on 23
February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Dear Bryan,

We refer further to the below email.

Kindly advise update on our request on reports pertaining to the values of the trailers.
Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877

| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 | Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No.
195000106C

A Member of B Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sq for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan

Sent: Thursday, 14 April 2022 12:19 pm

To: 'Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)' <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Henry Kao <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit on 23
February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Dear Bryan,

We refer further to the below email.

Kindly advise update on our request on reports pertaining to the values of the trailers.
Thank you.

Kind Regards,



Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877

| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 | Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No.
195000106C

A Member of LIEEEW Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sq for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is
intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the
message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Eileen Lee

Sent: Wednesday, 12 May 2021 2:39 pm

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit on 23
February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Dear Bryan,

Appreciate your call & advice.
We note that the salvage value at $1,410.05 is reasonable and justifiable & it would be deducted from the final
settlement sum.

As spoken, please let us have a report pertaining to the value of the trailers.
1. We attach the excel sheet for your ease of reference/ necessary actions
2. We attach the invoices provided by Ol.

Otherwise, please find the full set of documents in the link.
LINK: M Eco Waste- Fire dmg to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit on 23.02.17

Thank You.

Regards,
Eileen Lee (Ms)
Motor Claims Dept.

Email address
eileenlee@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Motor Claims E-mail : motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
Website: http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Rd #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | TEL : 6507 3848 |
Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

A Hember of IURTENNY INSURANCE GROUP



From: Eileen Lee

Sent: Friday, April 30, 2021 3:21 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit on 23
February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Hi Bryan,

Please kindly assist as per email below.

Thank You.

Regards,
Eileen Lee (Ms)
Motor Claims Dept.

Email address
eileenlee@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Motor Claims E-mail : motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
Website: http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Rd #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | TEL : 6507 3848 |
Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

A Hember of IURTENNY INSURANCE GROUP

From: Eileen Lee

Sent: Thursday, April 22, 2021 10:07 AM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit on 23
February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Hi Bryan,

Please assist me on the attached email.



Thank You.

Regards,
Eileen Lee (Ms)
Motor Claims Dept.

Email address
eileenlee@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Motor Claims E-mail : motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
Website: http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Rd #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | TEL : 6507 3848 |
Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

A Member of IRERENNY INSURANCE GROUP

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, March 26, 2021 9:33 AM

To: Eileen Lee <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit on 23
February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Hi Eileen,
We refer to the email below.
Our senior technical advisor have review the matter and the salvage value provided is reasonable and justifiable.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Eileen Lee <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 1 March 2021 11:02 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>




Subject: FW: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit on 23
February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Importance: High

Hi Asher,

As spoken, | am resending all documents.
Please refer to the link & save all the necessary documents for your file.

LINK: ﬁ Eco Waste- Fire dmg to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit on 23.02.17

It seems like this matter has not been attended since we appointed your firm.
We require the net loss value for each of the trailers covered under our policy (TPFT).

Please expedite.

Summary:-
. Policy
MAR S/N Vehicle no. D-17086951MFVS/6 | D-17086952MFVS/6 CLAIM NO
Risk 6 — TP
1 2.1 TRB4184C D17003680MFVS | NOT C
DAMA
RISK 8- TPFT
2 2.4 TRC1879X oD D17003681MFVS
RISK 83 — TPFT
3 7.8 TRD3409B oD D17003682MFVS
RISK 11 TPFT
4 9.1 TRB4306T oD D17003683MFVS
RISK 61 TPFT
5 12.6 TRD2789K oD D17003684MFVS
RISK 63 TPFT
6 12.8 TRD2809L oD D17003685MFVS
RISK 68 TPFT
7 14.3 TRD2851M oD D17003686MFVS
Thank You.
Regards,

Eileen Lee (Ms)

Motor Claims Dept.

Email address

eileenlee@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Motor Claims E-mail : motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Website: http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Rd #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | TEL : 6507 3848 |
Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C
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A Hember of IURTENNY INSURANCE GROUP

From: Eileen Lee

Sent: Monday, March 1, 2021 10:09 AM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit on 23
February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

OK. Thanks Bryan

Thank You.

Regards,
Eileen Lee (Ms)
Motor Claims Dept.

Email address
eileenlee@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Motor Claims E-mail : motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
Website: http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Rd #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | TEL : 6507 3848 |
Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

AMember of BINRRARNNY INSURANCE GROUP

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, March 1, 2021 10:06 AM

To: Eileen Lee <EileenLee@misfirstcapital.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit on 23
February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Hi Eileen

My colleague Asher would like to speak to you on this case. Can you call her at LKK office.
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Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

On 1 Mar 2021, at 09:29, Eileen Lee <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Bryan,

Please assist us on this matter.
There is no conclusion to-date.

Thank You.

Regards,
Eileen Lee (Ms)
Motor Claims Dept.

<image001.png>Email address
eileenlee@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Motor Claims E-mail : motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Website: http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Rd #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | TEL : 6507 3848 |

Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

<image002.jpg>

From: Eileen Lee

Sent: Tuesday, January 12, 2021 9:23 AM

To: assighments@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View

Circuit on 23 February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Dear Shirley,

As spoken, please assist to revert on these matters urgently.

Information are as attached.

Summary:-

MAR S/N

Vehicle no.

D-17086951MFVS/6

D-17086952MFVS/6

CLAIM NO

TRB4184C

Risk 6 —

D17003680MFVS




RISK 8-
2 2.4 TRC1879X oD D17003681MFVS
RISK 83 —
3 7.8 TRD3409B oD D17003682MFVS
RISK 11
4 9.1 TRB4306T oD D17003683MFVS
RISK 61
5 12.6 TRD2789K oD D17003684MFVS
RISK 63
6 12.8 TRD2809L oD D17003685MFVS
RISK 68
7 14.3 TRD2851M oD D17003686MFVS
Thank You.
Regards,

Eileen Lee (Ms)

Motor Claims Dept.

<image001.png>Email address
eileenlee@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Motor Claims E-mail : motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
Website: http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Rd #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | TEL : 6507 3848 |
Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C
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From: Eileen Lee

Sent: Friday, December 11, 2020 10:08 AM

To: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments@I|kkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View

Circuit on 23 February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Hi Summer,

Please let us have an update of these matters.

Thank You.

Regards,
Eileen Lee (Ms)




Motor Claims Dept.
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Motor Claims E-mail : motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C
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From: Eileen Lee

Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 11:31 AM

To: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@Ilkkauto.com
Subject: RE: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View
Circuit on 23 February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Dear Summer,

Please find the attached for your surveyor’s information.

Thank You.

Regards,
Eileen Lee (Ms)
Motor Claims Dept.
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Motor Claims E-mail : motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Rd #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | TEL : 6507 3848 |
Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C
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From: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 12, 2020 4:45 PM

To: Eileen Lee <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments@Ilkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com
Subject: RE: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View
Circuit on 23 February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial
Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Eileen Lee <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 12 November, 2020 4:26 PM

To: 'assignments@l|kkauto.com' <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View
Circuit on 23 February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Dear LKK,

We wish to appoint your end to settle these OD (FIRE) claims.
Kindly let us know should you need further documents (there are no accident/ incident reports
available).

Is your end able to communicate/ negotiate settlement through our brokers- Mr Lim, JitChik
<JitChik.Lim@marsh.com>?
Please acknowledge & let us know.

There is a total of 7 trailers involved, however, policy is only engaged for 6 vehicles.
Please refer to the policy schedule & wordings attached for your reference.

. D-
MAR S/N Vehicle no. D-17086951MFVS/6 17086952MFVS/6 CLAIM NO
Risk 6 —
1 2.1 TRB4184C D17003680MFVS
RISK 8-
2 2.4 TRC1879X oD D17003681MFVS
RISK 83 —
3 7.8 TRD3409B oD D17003682MFVS
RISK 11
4 9.1 TRB4306T oD D17003683MFVS
RISK 61
5 12.6 TRD2789K oD D17003684MFVS
6 12.8 TRD2809L RISK 63 D17003685MFVS
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RISK 68
7 14.3 TRD2851M oD D17003686MFVS
Thank You.
Regards,

Eileen Lee (Ms)
Motor Claims Dept.
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Motor Claims E-mail : motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Rd #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | TEL : 6507 3848 |
Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C
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From: Cecilia Low

Sent: Wednesday, June 7, 2017 3:20 PM

To: 'Michael Kwang' <michaelkwang@insightadjusters.com>

Cc: Novin Siah <NovinSiah@first-insurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View
Circuit on 23 February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Dear Mr. Kwang
We choose M/s Sky Metal Pte Ltd to provide the necessary services.

Meanwhile, please continue to render your assistance on the management of the matter.
Thank you.

Regards

(Ms) Cecilia Low

Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd

36 Robinson Road, #16-01 City House, Singapore 068877
Tel: 6507 3862 | Fax: 6507 3849

Website: www.first-insurance.com.sg

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
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Please refer to www.first-insurance.com.sq for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail.

From: Michael Kwang [mailto:michaelkwang@insightadjusters.com]

Sent: 07 June 2017 09:04

To: Jacqueline Leong <Jacquelineleong@first-insurance.com.sg>

Cc: Cecilia Low <Cecilialow@first-insurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View
Circuit on 23 February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Noted, Jacqueline.

Best regards,

Michael Kwang

Tel: +65 -6223 2008

E-Mail : michaelkwang@insightadjusters.com

From: Jacqueline Leong [mailto:Jacquelineleong@first-insurance.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 June 2017 9:02 AM

To: Michael Kwang <michaelkwang@insightadjusters.com>

Cc: Cecilia Low <Cecilialow@first-insurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View
Circuit on 23 February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Dear Michael

Please also include Ms Cecilia for your future emails (cecilialow@first-insurance.com.sq).

Thank you.

Best regards,
Jacq

Jacqueline Leong

Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd

36 Robinson Road, #16-01 City House, Singapore 068877
Tel: 6507 3860 | Fax: 6507 3849

Website: www.first-insurance.com.sg

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.first-insurance.com.sq for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail.

From: Michael Kwang [mailto:michaelkwang@insightadjusters.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 June, 2017 8:15 AM

To: 'novinseah@first-insurance.com.sg'; Jacqueline Leong

Cc: Stephen Kwang; Alex Salikin; Joycelyn Tan

Subject: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit
on 23 February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

Dear Novin and Jacqueline

14



Good morning to you.

We refer to our e-mail of yesterday evening and now attach a set of photographs
depicting the extent of fire damage to the 7 trailers reported to be insured under your
two Policies in force.

Best regards,

Michael Kwang

Tel: +65 -6223 2008

E-Mail : michaelkwang@insightadjusters.com

From: Michael Kwang

Sent: Tuesday, 6 June 2017 7:30 PM

To: 'novinseah@first-insurance.com.sg' <novinseah @first-insurance.com.sg>;
'lacquelineleong@first-insurance.com.sg' <jacquelineleong@first-insurance.com.sg>

Cc: Stephen Kwang <stephenkwang@insightadjusters.com>; 'Alex Salikin (AlexSalikin @first-
insurance.com.sg)' <AlexSalikin@first-insurance.com.sg>; 'Joycelyn Tan' <Joycelyntan@first-
insurance.com.sg>; Stephen Kwang <stephenkwang@insightadjusters.com>

Subject: Eco Special Waste Management Pte Ltd - Fire damage to 7 trailers at 23 Tuas View Circuit
on 23 February 2017 (Claim involving FCIL's Fleet - Heavy Vehicle Policies)

UPDATE — 6 June 2017

Dear Novin and Jacqueline
We refer to our e-mail of 6 April 2017.

This is to update you on the current development of the fire damage to the 7 units of
trailers at the Insured’s 23 TVC premises.

During our site inspection of the trailers on 25 May 2017, we were able to identify 1
out of the 7 trailers — Regn. No. TRD2851M - that is insured under item 68 of your
Policy No. D-17086952MFVS, whose name plate was still intact. The other 6 trailers
were entirely burnt; the registration plate numbers and ID tags on these 6 trailer
chassis were destroyed by the fire, making identification literally impossible.

Status of
SUM _ Date ID/nameplate Remarks
INSURED | inspected on the
Item TRAILER NO. INTEREST INSURED (%) machinery
Policy No. : D-
17086951MFVS
6 TRB 4184C PTES Skeletal-Container Trailer Market Value No
Chassis No. : PTES057002
Year of Manufacture : 2002
Policy No. : D-
17086952MFVS
8 TRC 1879X Hock Nam Seng 20' SKL TR Trailer Market Value No
Chassis No. : HNS961008
Year of Manufacture : 2008
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Soon Wing T Pte Ltd Skeletal-Container
Trailer

Chasis No. : SWTPL40282002
Year of Manufacture : 2002

11 TRB 4306T Market Value No

TETPL 20' Dual Axles Skeletal Container
Trailer

Chassis No. : TETPL00616
Year of Manufacture : 2016

61 TRD 2789K Market Value No

TETPL 20' Dual Axles Skeletal Container
Trailer

Chassis No. : TETPL00816
Year of Manufacture : 2016

63 TRD 2809L Market Value No

68 TRD 2851M Sin Trans Engrg PL 20' Dual Axles Skeletal Market Value Yes
Container TR Trailer
Chassis No. : STEPL424416
Year of Manufacture : 2016
83 TRD 3409B Yeo Tr International 12300mm Long Skeletal Market Value No
Container Trailer

Chassis No. : YTE37002016

Year of Manufacture : 2016

Double-mount

trailer

The Insured and Marsh are reviewing the trailer/container log books to determine the
identity of the remaining 6 trailers with the mounted ISO container tankers with a
view to match the trailers insured in your two Vehicle Policies in force.

| will be sending you a set of photographs of the 7 burnt trailers purportedly insured
under your policies in a separate e-mail tomorrow.

To free up space in their premises, the Insured would like to scrap off the 7 burnt
trailers. They have now obtained 3 competitive quotations from the LTA-approved
scrap merchants (as attached), which are summarized as follows:-

Quotation on Scrap Trailers (6x20ft — approximately 3 tons) & (1x 40ft — approximately 6

tons)

Vendors

Chuan Machinery Pte Ltd

Kiat Lee Machinery Pte Ltd

Sky Metal Pte Ltd

Price (offered

by vendors) $200/UNIT $800/- 7TUNITS $100/MT
Crane available YES YES YES
Value S$1,400 S$800 Approximately S$2,4(

The Insured informed that the 3 quotations submitted exclude the cost of
delivering/transporting the burnt trailers to the vendor’s scrap yard. The transport
cost will be borne by the Insured and this will be deducted from the salvage
proceeds. The Insured will let us know the transport cost and we will keep you

informed.

In this instance, Marsh has requested for Insurers to confirm your selection of the
preferred scrap vendor by Thursday, 8 June 2017. The quotations from the 3 scrap
vendors were sent to us by Marsh at 4.48pm today only.

Please let us know how you would like us to proceed with this matter. Alternatively,
you may wish to deal directly with Marsh.
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Best regards,
Michael Kwang
E-Mail : michaelkwang@insightadjusters.com

Insight Adjusters and Surveyors Pte Ltd
133 Cecil Street, #14-02

Keck Seng Tower

Singapore 069535

(65) 6223 2008 - Fax : (65) 6226 2356

http://www.insightadjusters.com

» ASIA Regional Office for vrs adjusters

* Loss Adjuster of the Year, Asia Insurance Industry Award
* A Singapore Top 500 SME

* CESAM Average Agents, AIMU Correspondents

<mime-attachment>

<mime-attachment>
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