Admin-D (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Hi Team

Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Tuesday, 26 April 2022 11:04 AM

Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments

Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Charandeep Singh

TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10014923 /CD || OI-SLW6692A (BLACK) TP-SJZ3623C || Est:
$0.00 || Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

TP Sketch plan.pdf; TP REPORT.PNG

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: SJZ3623C

Contact Person

Eric Lee 8879 9997

Email Address

teamautogl@gmail.com

Survey Address

160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Singapore 575722

Attached GIA report.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Shafawati Md Rabu
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3697
F +65 6725 0853

E shafawati.m@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Singapore
239924

budgetdirect.com.sg




auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct
Insurance.

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 April 2022 10:28 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 25/04/2022 || C10014923 || 2 Day Notice SJZ 3623 C (our ref) and SLW 6692 A (your ref)
3rd party: Auto & General DOA 20/04/2021

Dear Shafawati,
With reference to your list of surveyors, we are agreeable with the appointment of LKK as the SJE for subject claim.

Kindly note our personnel in charge for the survey as follows:-

Contact Person Eric Lee 8879 9997

Email Address teamautogl@gmail.com
Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Singapore 575722

Thank you for your kind attention to our request.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

**Dear all, please note that Team AutoPro Pte Ltd is GST registered w.e.f. 13th January 2021.

Best Regards,

David Seow

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956
Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722



From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 April 2022 11:26 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: 2 Day Notice SJZ 3623 C (our ref) and SLW 6692 A (your ref) 3rd party: Auto & General DOA 20/04/2021

Dear Sir/Madam,

Road Traffic Accident Involving SJZ 3623 C (Our Ref) and SLW 6692 A (Your Ref)
Dated 20 April 2022, Time around 2027HRS

@ MSCP of Blk 117 Jalan Tenteram Level 3

We represent our client; GOH JIA HUI, to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident involving our client’s vehicle
registration number: SJZ 3623 C and your insured’s vehicle registration number: SLW 6692 A.

Enclosed herewith a copy of the Singapore Accident Statement / Traffic Police Report filed for your reference.

Please kindly send us your list of at least ten (10) motor surveyors within 2 working days, via_

Contact Person Eric Lee 8879 9997
Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com
Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

**Dear all, please note that Team AutoPro Pte Ltd is GST registered w.e.f. 13th January 2021.




Best Regards,

David Seow

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956
Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722



