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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 1 November 2022 7:36 AM

To: simon@kkimhin.com.sg; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SLA 9998P TP CHINA DOA 23/03/22 FINALISATION

Dear Simon, 
 
, 
“Without Prejudice” 
 
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of Lump Sum $5,650/- with 6 days of repair, subject to 
their approval.  
 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: simon@kkimhin.com.sg <simon@kkimhin.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 31 October 2022 7:14 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SLA 9998P TP CHINA DOA 23/03/22 FINALISATION 

 

Hi Veron, 

 

I cannot get your figures. 

Lump Sum $5650.00 I got after you adjusted my part price. 

Which item I still missed out? 

 

Regards 

Simon 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 31 October 2022 10:44 AM 

To: simon@kkimhin.com.sg; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SLA 9998P TP CHINA DOA 23/03/22 FINALISATION 

 

Dear Simon, 

 

“Without Prejudice” 
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We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $5550/- with 6 days of repair, subject to their 

approval.  

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: simon@kkimhin.com.sg <simon@kkimhin.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 26 October 2022 7:06 PM 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SLA 9998P TP CHINA DOA 23/03/22 FINALISATION 

 

Hi, 

Any update? 

 

Regards 

Simon 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: simon@kkimhin.com.sg <simon@kkimhin.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 21 September 2022 8:58 AM 

To: kennethkong@lkkauto.com; 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)' <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SLA 9998P TP CHINA DOA 23/03/22 FINALISATION 

 

  Dear Kenneth, 

 

Enclosed for your attention. 

Lump Sum $5750.00 

06 repair days 

Please check and reply. 

 

Regards 

Simon 

 

 

Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link 

attachments: 

 

20220920184247 

 

 

Note: To protect against computer viruses, email programs may prevent you from sending or receiving certain types 

of file attachments. Check your email security settings to determine how attachments are handled. 

 

 


