Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 April, 2022 11:05 AM

To: 'sm automotive'; Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: SMS1602C CLAIMING AGAINST GBL2147K (AIG) DOA: 21.04.2022
Categories: HMK

Dear Yun Lij,

Thank you for the assignment.

Note: With immediate effect 04/03/2022 Summer Lee(assignment Team) will no longer be in our company.
Please contact the undersign for survey arrangement.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 April, 2022 10:04 AM

To: assignments@Ilkkauto.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SMS1602C CLAIMING AGAINST GBL2147K (AlG) DOA: 21.04.2022

Without Prejudice

Hi all

Referred to above mentioned, our client vehicle SMS1602C is a direct settlement with your good
surveyor firm.

Vehicle is in and my boss will arrange the survey with your good surveyor Adrian.

Enclosed GIA for your reference, thanks.



Regards,
Yun Li

SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276



