
4/29/22, 9:15 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQkAGNlMTQ1ODBhLTc0NjYtNGE3OC05NWVkLTMyZWUwMGFhNWIxNAAQAO8c5UKw5o5NpjG%2F… 1/1

Re: SMD 212E OD CHINA TAI PING

Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>
Thu 28/4/2022 10:11 AM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Cc: doris@sh-motor.com <doris@sh-motor.com>

Dear Denise, 


We regret to inform you that we are not able to undertake the repairs at $19000.


Thank you.


Best regards

Lum Wee Keat


On 26/4/2022 11:32 am, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) wrote:


Dear Sir/madam,

As spoken to wee kiat, repair limit at 19,000/-

Please check and let us know if able to repair within the limit

Call me at 91060645

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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