Admin-D (LKKAuto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 April 2022 3:17 PM

To: shimin poh; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: NEW THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT VEH NO : SLV9552G/SMU7038G DOA

18/04/2022 || C10014848

Dear Sirs,

We refer to your email below and noted on the contents.

Hi @Admin-D (LKKAuto) , please take note and cancel the survey request.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Shafawati Md Rabu
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3697
F +65 6725 0853
E shafawati.m@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Trusted
Service

Budget |Awad

- Direct | iicix
mnsurance 2022771{&_?'0”

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.s

autoalgeneral

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct
Insurance.

From: shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 27 April 2022 12:22 PM



To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Fwd: NEW THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT VEH NO : SLV9552G/SMU7038G DOA 18/04/2022

Dear All:
Please cancel claim, customer withdrew claim.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg>

Date: Mon, 25 Apr 2022, 10:14

Subject: NEW THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT VEH NO : SLV9552G/SMU7038G DOA 18/04/2022
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Albert Hong <Albert.hong@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Kindly arrange pre-repair survey for the above and if possible would like to do direct settlement.

Please provide us your list of surveyors for our selection.

Attached is the accident report for your reference and we're currently in the midst of preparing the estimate.
Thank you and hope to hear from you soon.

Thank You !

Bridget Poh (Shimin)

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1

#01-406 Singapore 408701
Office: 67431913 Fax: 67435234



