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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 April, 2022 8:55 AM

To: Summer (LKK Auto); sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Julie Mangubat

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10014879/JM || OI-SLZ4728D (GREY) TP- SJR5067L || Est: 

$8,657.20 || Hup Motor Trading & Service 

Attachments: Estimate.pdf; SJR5067L Report.pdf

Hi Team 

 

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: SJR5067L 

 

Survey date: 25/04/22 (13:30 hrs to 14:30 hrs) 

 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  

Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 

#01-120 

Singapore 528838  

 

Contact: David Ang / 9815 4655 

Attached TP report and estimate. 

 

 

Thank you. 

 

Warmest Regards, 

 

Shafawati Md Rabu 

Admin Executive, Claims 

 

T +65 6989 3697 

F +65 6725 0853   

E shafawati.m@budgetdirect.com.sg 

 

 
 

Customer Care +65 6221 2111 

Claims +65 6221 2199 

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 

 

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 

Singapore Shopping Centre 

Singapore 

239924                                                                                                                                  

budgetdirect.com.sg 
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget 

Direct Insurance. 

 

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 21 April 2022 5:16 PM 

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 21/04/22, INVOLVING CLIENT'S : (SJR 5067 L) & YOUR INSURED : (SLZ 4728 D) ALONG 

ANG MO KIO AVE 6 TWDS MARRY MOUNT RD 

 

Dear Sirs, 

 

Attach our estimate bill, GIA third party insurer search fee, GIA report, insurance certificate, log card & 

client's vehicle video footage for your reference & attention, 

 

Kindly assign your panel surveyor (LKK Auto Consultants Pte. Ltd, one of our insurer panel also) to 

survey client's damaged vehicle On : 25/04/22 (at : 13:30 hrs to 14:30 hrs) as owner waiting, 

 

Please revert & confirm client's third party claims liability, reference & OIC, as we are looking for direct 

settlement. 

 
Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 

Mailing Address : 
Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  


