DATE OF ISSUE OF IOD: 19 APR 22

TO: HSIAO TONG & JASLIN / 4254 3561
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Instrument of demand to engage the services of an insurance Claims Adjuster (Period

10D NO: CY 22/MID21263/130422/0014

Contract No: (DEFOO0ETT21000043)

DATE OF
UNIT/ HUB ACCIDENT MID & CIVILIAN INFORMATION REMARK
CIVILIAN MILITARY
VEH NO
SLH 2415P MID 21263
ACCIDENT INVOLVING
DRIVER NRIC = TXXXX0498 MILITARY VEHICLE MID 21263
TPT HUB 13/04/22 AND CIVILIAN VEHICLE SLH
EAST/SELARANG | ./ oc DRIVER CPLIACK NOAH |2415P ON 13 APRIL 2022 AT
NODE NAME = BELEN ALCID AROUND 0515 HRS ALONG
ENTRANCE TO TPE FROM
LOYANG AVENUE.
LHS mirror suffered
D@“éﬁlgfgo damage and LHS NIL
bumper scratched
Requesting Officer
Digitally signed by DATE:
EDWIN EDWIN KANG WEE
KANG WEE Huat B
Date: 2022.04.20 .
HUAT 09:53:19 +08'00'
GRA:

(SIGNATURE)

MAJ EDWIN KANG
HD Traffic Accident Investigation

& Education Sect
HQ Transport




it UOB

Successiul

Transfer to UOB Account

Application Date:  05/01/2023

From

g Company: Kame
. LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Aggousnit Numbe

3393019938

Te

Payee Name
SEN FATT DIESEL MOTOR

Amount & When

Value Date
06/01/2023

Payed Reference
CCUMIDAZ2003695/Ap

E
i
‘

Account Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

Currendy

SGD

Account Number
9143437643

Transachon Currengy
$GD

Bank Reference
FT23010200279751

Lurrendy
SGD

Transagton Amount
3.220.00

ot e e S S




Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT (MINDEF) <KANG_Wee_Huat_Edwin@defence.gov.sg>

Sent: Friday, 23 September 2022 12:26 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF); SHETH AADIT SACHIN (MINDEF); Olivia Lau
(LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: [Seek Mandate] - 10D: CY 22/MID21263/130422/0014// LKK Ref:

CC2/MIDA22003695/Ap

Message Classification: Official Open
Ok please proceed

Get Qutlook for Android

Erom: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

sent: Thursday, September 22, 2022 2:11:41 PM

To: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT (MINDEF) <KANG_Wee_Huat_Edwin@defence.gov.sg>

Ce: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF) <HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg>; SHETH AADIT SACHIN (MINDEF)
<Sheth_Aadit_Sachin@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [Seek Mandate] - 10D: CY 22/MID21263/130422/0014// LKK Ref: CC2/MIDA22003695/Ap

Your ref: CY 22/MID21263/130422/0014
LKK ref : CC2/MIDA22003695/Apqg2

Dear Maj Edwin,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID21263 AND SLH2415P ON 13/04/2022

We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when our SAF driver encroached into civilian’s lane while both were turning. We are of the
view our SAF driver is at fault.

We would like to seek your approval to negotiate and settle with civilian repairer.

The summary is as follows: -

Claimed Amount | Mandate Amount
1. Cost of Repair $ 8,740.20 $ 2,900.00
2. Loss of Use (4days x $100.00) S 400.00 S 400.00 (4days x $100.00)
Total | $9,140.20 $ 3,300.00

Enclosed herewith : -
e Survey Report & Photos — SLH2415P.
e LOD-SLH2415P
e Video Footage —SLH2415P
e SAF Report & Photos - MID21263

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 July 2022 5:02 PM

To: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT <KANG_Wee_Huat_Edwin@defence.gov.sg>; HO AIK SENG, DENNIS
<HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg>; RISHABH RADHAKRISHNAN <Rishabh_Radhakrishnan@defence.gov.sg>
Ce: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: I0D: CY 22/MID21263/130422/0014// LKK Ref: CC2/MIDA22003695/Ap

Your Ref: CY 22/MID21263/130422/0014
LKK Ref: CC2/MIDA22003695/Ap

Dear Sirs,

We have conducted inspection for SLH2415P.

Please refer to the attached appraisal of damaged vehicle before repair and photos for your perusal.
Qur further advice will follow in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@Ilkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy,
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under

2




the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately
if you receive this in error.”



Hsiao To ﬂ2 (LKKAUtO) e

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 22 December 2022 11:45 AM

'EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT (MINDEF)'

HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF); SHETH AADIT SACHIN (MINDEF); Olivia Lau
(LKKAuto)

RE: [Seek Mandate] - |OD: CY 22/MID2‘I263/130422/0014// LKK Ref:

CC2/MIDA22003695/Ap

We have completed settlement at $3,220.00(all-in) with M/s SIN FATT DIESEL MOTOR acting for third party.

1. Cost of Repair

$2,900.00

2. Loss of Use (4days x $80.00)

S 320.00

Total | $ 3,220.00

Third party vehicle is insured with M/s Auto & General Insurance (S) PL - (Budget Direct Insurance) which is non-
signatory to TCA. As such TCA is not applicable.

In view of this, We will proceed to close file and submit invoice to your good office soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT (MINDEF) <KANG_Wee_Huat_Edwin@defence.gov.sg>

Sent: Friday, 23 September 2022 12:26 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF) <HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg>; SHETH AADIT SACHIN (MINDEF)
<Sheth_Aadit_Sachin@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [Seek Mandate] - 10D: CY 22/MIDZl263/13D422/0014// LKK Ref: CC2/M|DA22003695/Ap

Message Classification: Official Open

Ok please proceed

Get Outlook for Android




From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 22, 2022 2:11:41 PM

To: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT (MINDEF) <KANG Wee Huat Edwin@defence.gov.sg>

Cc: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF) <HO Aik Seng Dennis@defence.gov.sg>; SHETH AADIT SACHIN (MINDEF)
<Sheth Aadit Sachin@defence.gov.sg>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <glivialau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [Seek Mandate] - I0D: CY 22/MID21263/13D422/0014// LKK Ref: CC2/MIDA22003695/Ap

Your ref: CY 22/MID21263/130422/0014
LKK ref : CC2/MIDA22003695/Apg2

Dear Maj Edwin,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID21263 AND SLH2415P ON 13/04/2022

We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when our SAF driver encroached into civilian’s lane while both were turning. We are of the
view our SAF driver is at fault.

We would like to seek your approval to negotiate and settle with civilian repairer.

The summary is as follows: -

Claimed Amount | Mandate Amount
1. Cost of Repair S 8,740.20 $2,900.00
2. Loss of Use (4days x $100.00) S 400.00 $ 400.00 (4days x $100.00)
Total | $9,140.20 $ 3,300.00

Enclosed herewith : -
« Survey Report & Photos — SLH2415P.
e LOD-SLH2415P
e Video Footage — SLH2415P
s SAF Report & Photos - MID21263

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 12 July 2022 5:02 PM



To: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT <KANG Wee Huat Edwin@defence.gov.sg>; HO AIK SENG, DENNIS

<HO Aik Seng Dennis@defence.gov.sg>; RISHABH RADHAKRISHNAN <Rishabh Radhakrishnan@defence.gov.sg>
Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: 10D: CY 22/MID21263/130422/0014// LKK Ref: CC2/MIDA220036595/Ap

Your Ref: CY 22/MID21263/130422/0014
LKK Ref: CC2/MIDA22003695/Ap

Dear Sirs,

We have conducted inspection for SLH2415P.

Please refer to the attached appraisal of damaged vehicle before repair and photos for your perusal.
Our further advice will follow in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this
message. |f you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy,
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately
if you receive this in error."



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 September 2022 11:26 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fwd: SLH2415P & 21263MID DOA 13.4.22

Attachments: INVOICE.pdf; log card.pdf; SE09224D0002_13-04-2022_154854.pdf
Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Enclosed is the GIA , invoice .
As request following :

1)RC $ 2900 (- As agreed )
2) loss of use $400 ( $100 - X 4 DAYS - 3 days recommend + 1 day waiting PRS )

@ 100% TOTAL $3300-

Please let us have your settlement soon . Thanks

Best Regards

Chris Chan

SIN FATT DIESEL MOTOR
HP: 92712214



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

SIN FATT DIESEL MOTOR
BLOCK 3020A UBI

ROAD I #01-33

i# 05-441 SINGAPORE 408714

Dear Sir,
" 13.04.2022 @ 0500HRS
Accident on
lnva[ving Vehicle Nos SLH2415P & 21263MID
Along LOYANG AVE TURNING INTO PTE

SLH2514P

I /We.the registered owner /driver of vehicle registration no:
have involved in the above accident.

I/We hereby authorize M/S SIN FATT DIESEL MOTOR to commence repairs of the said vehicle
forthwith.

[/We agree to assign the whole proceeds of my/our comprehensive/third party claim to you and our
solicitors to act on my/our behalf in respect of the above
matter. And if applicable.my/our solicitors shall accept this as my/our irrevocable authority to pay
the amount as deemed compensated direct to you after deduction of their costs on a Solicitor and
client basis.

I'We undertake to co-operate fully with you and our solicitors to ensure that claim is successful.

I'We also authorize you to sign all discharge vouchers/indemnity forms and all necessary papers in
relation with the above claim in my/our absence.

Your kind co-operation in this matter will be much appreciated.

Thank you.
Yours truly.

1&@% f__
Owner's Signature

{Company's stamp if applicable)

Name: TANWEE JIN

NRIC N PAIHIE

Date:




DISCHARGE VOUCHER AND INDEMNITY

Claimant Ref: SLH2415P 10D Ne: CY 22/MID21263/130422/0014

I / We, the undersigned TAN WEE JIN DO HEREBY AGREE that payment by the

Government of the Republic of Singapore as represented by the Ministry of Defence
(hereinafier referred 1o as the “Government™) of the sum of SGD THREE THOUSAND
TWO HUNDRED TWENTY ONLY (853.220.00) shall be the full and final settlement of

all claims (other than Personal Injury Claims) howsoever arising out of or in connection with

the damages caused to my/our vehicle no. SLH2415P, in an accident involving Government
vehicle no. MID21263 on 13/04/2022 at’ along LOYANG AVE TURNING INTO TPE
(TRAFFIC JUNCTION).

I/ We hereby authorize you to make payment in favour of SIN FATT DIESEL MOTOR.

I/ We agree that the payment is made without any admission of liability on the part of the
Government or any agent or servant of the Government, I'We declare that 'We have no further
claim whatsoever against the Government or any agent or servant of the Government in respect
of the abovementioned incident and hereby give the Government a full and final discharge in
respect of any liability or liabilities (Excluding Personal Injury Claims) which may arise out
of the aforesaid accident.

I'We also declare that | any'We are the person entitled to receive the above compensation and
hereby undentake to indemnify the Government against any claim made or which may be made

by any person in connection with this matter.

Date: "@ < /L g,‘] 2
—_—
Signature of Claimant (with company stamp if applicabla):k“ ‘g-l

Name of Claimant: TAN WEE JIN

If the Claimant is a Company or Firm, Name and Designation
Of the person signing on behalf of the Company or Firm.

4,

Signature of Witness: } /,«,i A
TEO HOCK BENG

Name and Designation of Witness:




2017

SIN FATT DIESEL MOTOR

Blk 3020A #01-33 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408714
Business Reg.No: 377435/00K

INVOICE

TAN WEE JIN Date: 14" Sept 22
Blk 3020A #01-33

Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408714

Accident date: 13" APRIL 2022
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SLH2415P TOYOTA VOXY 1.8

Descriptions AMOUNT

Lump Sum repair cost as recommended by $2,900.00

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Total] _ $2,900.00

S/ DLRS : TWO THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED ONLY

Page 756



SIN FATT DIESEL MOTOR

8 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 #05-25 PREMIER @ KB SINGAPORE 415875

TAN WEE JIN .
BLOCK 3020A UBI ROAD 1 TP Mnd of -
#01-33 S Gl

Singapore 408714 Xoton Tan ‘,}

Accident date: 13" APRIL 2022
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: SLH2415P Toyota Voxy 1.8 ' 2016 *

18" APRIL 2022

;3 iﬂf F 2 ‘Wb ?4; g} fy’} (

sm Qry ltems Ulprice Amount
1 1 Fronthead lamp -LH 2470 ¢ $1,655.20
Pl 1 Front head lamp lower brazﬁel SLH N $78.20 X ta
3 1 Frontbumper 024 .
4 2 Front bumper side bracket r-f pa $135.20 $270.40 X
5 *0 Frent bumper clips M, $5.00 $50.00 3
€ !t Frent bumper grille i $285.60 s
7 1 Front Bumper Fog lamp -RH 714 o0 $185.20 &
8 1_FrontRH side mirror Assy /... I e g
9 1 Rear fender -RH P pas $1,552.20 X .
e e Subtotal :- $6,560.20
LG d
SR
} 2 2 | €] 2
Labour charges 2.3
ro Check Wiring System $6 7
b} ;f -
SR
Tuff Kote /0 U $1}o.1§6 30
Panel beating $1,W L
Spray painting 51.00/‘7'/60/-5 Jo
Subtotal :- $2,180.00
Total:- $8,740.20
LKK Auto ' Consy itants hence noij ,f} s e
the Reparrer of the foflowing: . | 7f gl d [ O6E00D
* To resurvey :
- A il
9718 6n8 “Winow! Prejudice” basis {—/J (9
HEALS) 13 alioweg | i
0% I
Acknowledged by Reparer ‘

J: {\A dure:
Date:




874 7aR%

g Consultants
el I Company Registration No. 199607198R

SEUBLAVE L #02-25 PAYA UBIFINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (165} 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Mindef ref: CY 22/MI1D21263/130422/0014

LKK ref: CC2/MIDA22003695/Ap Date: 12.07.2022
HQ TRANSPORT COMMAND
Attn: Maj Edwin

Dear Sir/Madam

APPRAISAL OF DAMAGED VEHICLE BEFORE REPAIRS: SLH 2415P

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
18/4/2022  at the premises of M/s Sin Fatt Diesel Motor
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S% 8,740.20
Revised Estimate Amount : S$ 3,686.55
"Check" Items Amount : S$
Total : S§ 3,686.55
Market Value : S§ (est)
LTA Reimbursement Value : 8§ (est)
Nett Value : 8% - (est)
nearside
Description of Damage: rear o
The vehicle sustained damages at the
FRONT N/S PORTION offside

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3 days

Yours faithfully,

Adrian Ling
Licensed Appraiser



'Y V'l /4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
) 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

PHOTOGRAPHS FOR VEHICLE NO. SLH 2415P

INSPECTION




' B V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e - ;‘. ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R




'Y V4 V4 LKK Auto Consuiltants Pte Ltd

AR BS » 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315




'Y V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sdlin 2o > 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R




I B /4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

“'_,"' V-1 — 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

PHOTOGRAPHS FOR VEHICLE NO. SLH 2415P

RE-INSPECTION




I B V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
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'Y Vd V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R




¥ EJLS  Aue
o s Consultants
BB M2 B Pte Ltd Company Registration No. 199607198R

STUBFAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563361 FAX : (065) 62564315

Mindef ref: CY 22/MID21263/130422/0014
LKK ref:  CC2/MIDA22003695/Apq?2

HQ TRANSPORT COMMAND
Attn: Maj Edwin

Dear Sir/Madam

APPRAISAL OF DAMAGED VEHICLE AFTER REPAIRS: SLH2415P

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we have completed our assessment on third party vehicle.

Attached here with a copy of our appraisal report (after repair) for your reference.
Please refer to the adjustment on repair cost for vehicle no. SLH2415P for details.

Thank you.

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Licensed Appraiser



' V4l ) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
b; :‘; ‘: : 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En'AL_ltomobile
MINISTRY OF DEFENCE Ref:  CC2/MIDA22003695/Apg2
HQ TRANSPORT COMMAND Date: 23/08/2022
KRANJI CAMP 3
151 CHOA CHU KANG WAYSINGAPORE 688248
Code: MIDA
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. MID 21263 Veh. Inspected SLH 2415P
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CY 22/MID21263/130422/0014 |Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 21/04/2022
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition o
Make & Model TOYOTA VOXY HYBRID c.c 1797
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. ZWR800210501 Colour WHITE
Odometer 112132 KM Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 DUNLOP 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre [195/65 R15 DUNLOP 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 DUNLOP 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 195/65 R15 DUNLOP 6 mm
4, ~ Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. . ~ General Information
Accident Date  13/04/2022 Inspection Date 18/04/2022
Survey held at  SIN FATT DIESEL MOTOR
BLK 3020A UBI ROAD 1 #01-38 .
SINGAPORE 408714
5a. Remarks :
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b., Estimate Days of Repair .

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLH 2415P
Description of Parts Condition ﬁi:gﬁ?p%» Our Afs')“ted
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT HEAD LAMP -LH CRACKED 1,655.20 1,655.20
1|FRONT HEAD LAMP LOWER BRACKET LH NOT NECESSARY 78.20 -
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 1,558.20 1,025.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET @$135.20 NOT NECESSARY 270.40 -
0|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS @$5.00 NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|FRONT BUMPER GRILL NOT NECESSARY 285.60 -
1|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP -RH NOT NECESSARY 185.20
1|FRONT RH SIDE MIRROR ASSY CRACKED 925.20 925.20
1|REAR FENDER -RH NOT NECESSARY 1,652.20 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -908.85
6,560.20 2,726.55
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM. 60.00 30.00
TUFF KOTE. 120.00 30.00
PANEL BEATING. 1,000.00 400.00
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,000.00 500.00
2,180.00 960.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,740.20 3,686.55

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

2,900.00

Report Ref No. CC2/MIDA22003695/Apg2

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

No liability of re b whatsoeve lact or tort
Report, in whole or in part, does so at his or her own risk




'Y Vd V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

PHOTOGRAPHS FOR VEHICLE NO. SLH 2415P

RE-INSPECTION




RESTRICTED \ SENSITIVE NORMAL

Front View Rear View

e
l . P pt® -
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Left Side View Right Side View

Figure 1A: Vehicle Photographs

1
RESTRICTED \ SENSITIVE NORMAL



RESTRICTED \ SENSITIVE NORMAL

Front View of SLH2415P Rear View of SLH2415P

Damage Assessment: Civilian vehicle suffered left side mirror damage and
left front bumper suffered scratches.

Figure 1B: Civilian Vehicle Front and Rear View

2
RESTRICTED \ SENSITIVE NORMAL



RESTRICTED \ SENSITIVE NORMAL

Left Side View of SLH2415P Right Side of SLH2415P

Damage Assessment: Civilian vehicle suffered left side mirror damage and
left front bumper suffered scratches.

Figure 1C: Civilian Car Side View

3
RESTRICTED \ SENSITIVE NORMAL



RESTRICTED \ SENSITIVE NORMAL

TRAFFIC LIGHT

5TON 21263MID and civilian
vehicie SLH2415P were

turning right onto TPE from
Loyang Avenue.

Legend

SLH2415P

21263MID

1 i DICD

SHBS5020D

)

Civilian Bus

Figure 2A: Schematic Diagram Pt. 1

TRAFFIC LIGHT

Figure 2B: Schematic Diagram Pt. 2
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While turning right along the
entry to TPE, 5TON
21263MID and SLH2415P are
alongside each other with
SLH2415P slightly behind.

Legend

SLH2415P

21263MID

SHB5020D

Civilian Bus
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TRAFFIC LIGHT

Anticipating approaching the
merging lane, TO checks for
clearance on the right, and
strayed towards the right
lane.

Tegend

SLH2415P

21263MID

SHB5020D

Civilian Bus

TRAFFIC LIGHT The rear part of 21263MID

g s : grazed the front left part of
SLH2415P, causing damage
to the left side mirror and
front left bumper.

B end
. ——
. 21263MID
ﬁ SHBS5020D
ﬁ Civilian Bus

Figure 2D: Schematic Diagram Pt. 4
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TRAFFIC LIGHT ' s

21263MID  and SLH2415P
| both came to a halt then
| continued slowly to the road
shoulder up ahead after the
entryway to TPE.

Legend

SLH2415P

21263MID

SHB5020D

Civilian Bus

Figure 2E: Schematic Diagram Pt. 5
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TR0 04 | NOOT

1ol

Fepen o T022041 32007

COMTSUATHON OF REPORT
oh & copy of your vehcia's lsurance Cantificate 10 this rapar. lwmm
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Figure 4C: Police Report Pt. 3
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