Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 May 2022 10:56 AM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Finalization for PA6977Y
Attachments: PA 6977 main estimate (1).pdf

Hi Shiau Chan,

Workshop agreed finalize.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 5 May 2022 9:18 am

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Winnie Chai (via Google Drive) <connect3winnie@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Finalization for PA6977Y

Hi Steve,
ok. please proceed

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136

Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road
(Mandai Estate) S 728697

On Wed, May 4, 2022 at 7:26 PM Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Ms Lau,




We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $9050 (L/S before GST) - with 7 days of repair, subject
to their approval.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 29 April 2022 5:49 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; Winnie Chai (via Google Drive)
<connect3winnie@gmail.com>

Subject: Finalization for PA6977Y

Hi Steve
Attached is the after repair photos.
Pls kindly revert on the finalization.

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136

Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road
(Mandai Estate) S 728697



