Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 April, 2022 1:31 PM

To: Summer (LKK Auto); sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Julie Mangubat

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10014756/JM || OI-SGK5649E (Silver) TP-PA6977Y || Est:
$0.00 || Connect 3

Attachments: OI Report.pdf; TP Report PA6977Y.pdf

Hi Team

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: PA6977Y
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697

Contact : Ms Lau / 8188 4136

Attached GIA reports.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Shafawati Md Rabu
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3697
F +65 6725 0853
E shafawati.m@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 April 2022 12:56 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>; Justin Wong <justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Request for pre repair inspection for accident involving PA6977Y & SGK5649E ( yr insured ) on 14 Apr
2022

Hi Julie
We would like LKK to attend the survey.

Thanks

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 April 2022 11:28 am

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Justin Wong <justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Winnie Chai (via
Google Drive) <connect3winnie@gmail.com>

Subject: Request for pre repair inspection for accident involving PA6977Y & SGK5649E ( yr insured ) on 14 Apr 2022

Attached is the GIA report.

Pls kindly let us have the surveyor list for the PRI.

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697

Winnie Chai
Connect3
HP:9850-9666



