Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Trident Auto <tridentauto.claims@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 30 December 2022 4:.08 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: Re: FW: SLV4709E - Finalize

Dear Veron,

We accept the offer L/sum $2900.

Warmest Regards,
ZHE CHIAN

Trident Auto Service Centre Pte Ltd

8 Kaki bukit Ave 4 #02-42 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

T (65)63441918 F (65)6744 9778

DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not
misuse, copy, disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If
you are not the intended recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. The sender shall
not be liable for any loss or damage caused by viruses transmitted by this e-mail or its attachments. As the integrity of
this message cannot be guaranteed, The sender shall not be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email
may not necessarily represent the opinion of TRIDENT AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD.

On Wed, Dec 28, 2022 at 2:14 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Any updates.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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From: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 16 December 2022 1:03 PM

To: tridentauto.claims@gmail.com

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SLV4A709E - Finalize

Hi Sir,

Kindly refer our finalize $2900 (L/S, before GST). 4 days.

Your finalisation email can add in subject to insurance approval.

Thanks
Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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