
1

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Ong Hua Yen (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <HuaYen.Ong@strides.com.sg>
Sent: Sunday, 10 July 2022 2:08 PM
To: Admin A; CS A Team
Cc: Chong Fei Yuan (StridesASvcs/FM&SuppSvcs/Claims & IA); Balqish Binte Abdul Halil 

(Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd); Tan Wei Teck 
(StridesASvcs/FM&SuppSvcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA); Karen Chan Siau Chin 
(StridesASvcs/FM&SuppSvcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA); Foo Chit Yan (Strides 
Automotive Services Pte Ltd)

Subject: OUR REF:BUS/04/22/5008(AIG) - ACCIDENT ON 04/04/22  INVOLVING SG5959P 
AND SNC1199Y ALONG BKE before Bukit Panjang exit (towards CCKI)

Attachments: BUS 04 22 5008 LTA.pdf; BUS 04 22 5008 INV.pdf; BUS 04 22 5008 SAS.pdf

Dear Sirs,  
  
We claim on behalf of SMRT Buses Ltd, owner of the vehicle registration number SG5959P. Your client's 
negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,  
 

Cost of Repair $5,750.00            

Loss of Use $1,400.00  ( 4 days x $350.00  ) 

LTA search fee $7.00            

Total $7,157.00            
 
We enclose the following 
documents,                                                                                                                                  

1)   1) Repair Invoice 
2)   2) GIA report 

3) LTA Search Fee 
  
We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email. 
Payment by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT Buses Ltd.  
 
Thanks & Regards 
Hua Yen 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 26 April 2022 12:42 PM
To: TOMOIBESI@GMAIL.COM
Subject: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNC 1199Y(AIG) /SG 5959P/ OTHERS 

AT/ALONG BKE TO SLE (NEAR EXIT BUKIT PANJANG)ON 04/04/2022

26 April 2022 
  
Mr MOHAMED SHAHRIN BIN MOHAMED RAMLI                                                          [By Email Only] 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: SNC1199Y 
Our Ref: CC3/AIG22003610/Epa3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNC 1199Y(AIG) /SG 5959P/ OTHERS AT/ALONG BKE TO SLE (NEAR EXIT BUKIT 
PANJANG)ON 04/04/2022 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SG5959P against your insurance policy. 
  
Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information 
given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to 
negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. 
  
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Please be informed that your No-Claim Discount (NCD – if applicable) will be withheld for the time being. Pending 
for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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Claim Audit

 

 
AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
19 Apr
2022
23:43

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> SMRT BUSES LTD. Claimant's ID: -> 198202292D. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
19 Apr
2022
23:43

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(204258) MAN A95 10.5 D (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
19 Apr
2022
23:43

Clm Created
Reg No: SG5959P. Acct Date: 2022/04/04. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
(SG). TP Insurer: MS First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ). Workshop: Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd
(Woodlands)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
19 Apr
2022
23:43

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5
19 Apr
2022
23:43

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/04/28 [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

6
19 Apr
2022
23:43

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

7
19 Apr
2022
23:43

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Ex
press)

[A] Merimen
Administrator

8
19 Apr
2022
23:43

Label Added (20224):Field Survey. [A] Merimen
Administrator

9
19 Apr
2022
23:44

Label Added (23):Express. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

10
19 Apr
2022
23:44

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> CHEN TSUE YEE [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

11
26 Apr
2022
12:30

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

12
26 Apr
2022
12:30

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

13
28 Apr
2022
09:16

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Goh,

Jeremy-CX

14
28 Apr
2022
09:16

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Goh,

Jeremy-CX

15
13 Jun
2022
16:04

Video
Downloaded Downloaded GBL 7362 C Video - Other [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

16
13 Jun
2022
16:04

Video
Downloaded Downloaded GBL 7362 C Video - Other [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

17
13 Jul
2022
16:36

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

18
13 Jul
2022
16:36

Clm Dtl
Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

19
13 Jul
2022
16:36

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2018/09/20.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

20
13 Jul
2022
16:36

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

21
14 Jul
2022
09:47

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:7157.00:Liability: 100%(B28)
*Quantum: (a)COR: $5,750.00 + (b)LOU(4days x $350.00): $1,
400.00 + (c)Search fee: $7.00 = Total: $7,157.00
*3recommendation repair days +1PRS = 4days
*For
your approval please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

22
18 Jul
2022
12:04

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2022/04/28. Mandate Remarks: mandate approved. settle at 3 days LOR.
subject to documents in order

[I] Goh,
Jeremy-CX

23
18 Jul
2022
12:04

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:6807.00:mandate approved. settle at 3 days LOR. subject to documents in order [I] Goh,

Jeremy-CX

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go



ACTIVITY
[26/04/2022 12:32] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
OI video shows that OI had stopped and hit by the last car, the impact caused OI vehicle to move forward and hit TP bus.
[26/04/2022 12:32] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
100% B28 28; Ass:0%

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=96132874&CFTOKEN=c639116708a12d05-2D4C2220-DF13-18F6-32C899463D415E98&USID=3251&RID=9209956
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=96132874&CFTOKEN=c639116708a12d05-2D4C2220-DF13-18F6-32C899463D415E98&USID=3251&RID=9209956
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=96132874&CFTOKEN=c639116708a12d05-2D4C2220-DF13-18F6-32C899463D415E98&USID=3251&RID=9209956
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=96132874&CFTOKEN=c639116708a12d05-2D4C2220-DF13-18F6-32C899463D415E98&USID=3251&RID=9209956&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1084787%26extid%3D383983%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=96132874&CFTOKEN=c639116708a12d05-2D4C2220-DF13-18F6-32C899463D415E98&USID=3251&RID=9209956
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[26/04/2022 12:32] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
GBL7326C -> SNC1199Y(OI) -> SG5959P(TP)



Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2785064 21 Apr 2022
10:23:13

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

SG5959P SNC1199Y 11.00

2787353 28 Apr 2022
09:22:01 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SG5959P Goh, Jeremy-
CX xx.xx

2817035 13 Jul 2022
16:36:29

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SG5959P SNC1199Y 11.00









