Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@misfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 April, 2022 4:34 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan

Cc: Precise Auto Service

Subject: FW: D22001114MFCV/GBL/VS/TPD 1 SND 7283S (our Insured Vehicle no :
YQ5648M).

Attachments: 18042022182756.pdf; MSA.pdf; MT00015085 is Approved (4.94 KB)

Dear Sirs,

Enclosed is our survey assignment.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Harminder Kaur
Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
A Member of EEEENH Insurance Group

36 Robinson Road, #16-01 City House, Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | Fax: 6507 3849 |Reg. No. 195000106C

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sqg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Precise Auto Service <Support@preciseauto.sg>

Sent: Monday, 18 April 2022 6:39 pm

To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: Pre-repair Inspection For SND 7283S (Your Insured Vehicle no : YQ 5648M).

Dear Sir,

We refer to the above matter. Herewith attached 2 days' PRI notice for your attention.

Kindly arrange a date and time to do PRI for our client vehicle (SND 7283S) in our workshop ASAP.

Thank You.



Best Regards

Arine

T:67457367 | F: 68413390
E : support@preciseauto.sg
W: www.preciseauto.sg

A : No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-33/34/36 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883

Follow us on social media:

tips://www.instagram.com/preciseautosys/

ttps://www.facebook.com/PreciseAutoService/




